
Tabsheet Cobb County School District
IFB B2034 Digital Duplicators and Supplies

Page 1 of 2

Awarded vendor outlined in bold.

# MFG Part # Unit Price
1.0

S-8191
S-7135
S-4222

S-8113U
S-8188UA

1.2 $2,250.00

1.3 S-6361 $295.00
1.4 S-3451 $198.00
1.5 N/A N/A
1.6 S-4222 Included in price
1.7 S-8112 $1,100.00
1.8 S-8111 $550.00

2.0
S-8194
S-7135
S-4222

S-8113U
S-8131UA

2.2 $2,250.00

2.3 $295.00
2.4 $198.00
2.5 N/A
2.6 Included in price
2.7 $1,100.00

#
3
4
5

# MFG Part # Vendor Part # Unit Price Case Price

6 817113 No Bid
7 817225 No Bid
8 893536 No Bid
9 893023 No Bid

10 893196 No Bid
11 893529 No Bid
12 220852 No Bid
13 893546 No Bid

14 S-4254 S-8113 $18.00 $180.00
15 S-8113U S-8113 $18.00 $180.00
16 S-4250 S-8188 $28.50 $285.00
17 S-4363 S-8131 $38.50 $385.00
18 S-8188UA S-8188 $28.50 $285.00
19 S-8131UA S-8131 $38.50 $385.00
20 S-658 S-658 N/A $26.00

SouthEast Office Systems
Net 30 day

Vendor:
Terms:

Option I – New Duplicator Purchase including 5 Years Repair/PM

One (1) full roll of masters installed
Full Repair Service and Preventative Maintenance – 5 Years

Description
Riso SF5130EIIU Digital Duplicator

Riso SF5450EIIU Digital Duplicator

2.1 $3,895.00

Riso SF5450EIIU Digital Duplicator, to include:
Auto Document Feeder VII

One (1) full black ink cartridge installed

Vendor Part #

1.1 $2,595.00

Riso SF5130EIIU Hardware Options

Stand D Type III

Auto Document Feeder VII

Black Ink for SF5130, SF5450, SF5130EIIU, SF5450EIIU (F Type)

Masters for SF5130, SF5130EIIU (F Type)

Masters for EZ221 (Z Type)
Masters for EZ391

Masters for SF5450, SF5450EIIU (F Type)
Tape for EZ221 and EZ391 Tape Dispenser

Card Feed Kit 
Envelope Feed Kit
Stand N (Type III)
IC Card Reader Activation Kit RG 

Riso Supplies

Ricoh Supplies

Option III - Consumable Supplies

Masters for Priport DD3334, DX3343 (JP10S)

Marker Tape (Type 20)

Black Ink for Priport DD4450, DX4545 (HQ40)

Masters for Priport DD4450, DX4545 (HQ40L)

Black Ink for Priport DD5450 (Type 500)

Masters for Priport DD5450 (Type 500)

Marker Tape (Type D1)

Black Ink for Priport DD3334, DX3343 (JP30)

Description

Description
Hourly Rate for Labor

Black Ink for EZ221, EZ391 (Z Type)

Option II – Non-Warranty Work/Repair

Riso SF5130EIIU Digital Duplicator, to include:

Stand D Type III
One (1) full black ink cartridge installed
One (1) full roll of masters installed

Full Repair Service and Preventative Maintenance – 5 Years

Network Kit S10

Job Separator IV; NIII
Card Feed Kit 
Envelope Feed Kit

Job Separator IV; NIII

Parts - % discount off MSRP or Cost + % markup
Travel charges – Per ST&C 4.10.4

Rates
$125.00

20%
None

Stand N (Type III)
IC Card Reader Activation Kit RG 

Riso SF5450EIIU Hardware Options
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SouthEast Office Systems
Net 30 day

Vendor:
Terms:

#

21

Email:

Josh Gregory
678-393-2700

jgregory@seosdigital.com
Lisa Hunt

678-393-2700
lhunt@seosdigital.com

Contact Name:
Phone #:

Email:
Contact Name:

Phone #:Service/Warranty Issues

Per ST&C 2.3, provide contact information (name, phone #, email) for the following:
Vendor Contact Information

Account Representative

Discount
Description Discount

Per Section 12.9 of the Special Terms & Conditions, in the event CCSD has failed to include an 
item(s), responding vendors are asked to provide a fee structure for additional, related items 
that may be purchased during the award period.  Vendors are to identify the pricing source 
and the associated fee structure in the space to the right.  Some example responses are:  X% 
discount below MSRP; X% discount below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up.

30%
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