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Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Furniture
1 Audio Station, Mobile Junior  Hardwood unit rolls on casters.  Room on top for CD player and 

junction box plus headphones.  Underneath it has one shelf for storage.  Made of Birch Plywood. 
Approx. 27 3/4"long x  14 3/4" wide x  23 3/4" high. Childcraft 1301528 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent.

Each Wood Designs WD991487 * Lifetime $265.40
10+ $257.90

$240.40
10+ $232.90

No Bid No Bid

2 Cabinet, Storage (2 Shelves).  Three compartment mobile storage cabinet with an open top shelf 
and 2 open sections on the bottom. Heavy-duty casters on the bottom make it easy to move. 
Assembled unit measures 47-3/4 W x 14-1/4 D x 30 H inches.  To be constructed of hardwood 
rounded corner blocks that prevent sharp corners.  Kickboard to surround entire base.  All joints 
to be dadoed and secured by screws.  Childcraft Korners for Kids 272155 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent. 

Each Wood Designs WD13030 * Lifetime $453.00
10+ $428.00

$428.00
10+ $413.00

No Bid No Bid

3 Cabinet, Storage (3 Shelves).  Spacious compartments provide versatile storage for materials of 
all shapes and sizes, while staying within easy reach. To be constructed of hardwood rounded 
corner blocks that prevent sharp corners.  Heavy-duty casters. approx. 47-3/4 in W x 14-1/4 in D x 
36 in H. Childcraft Korners for Kids 249351 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each Wood Designs WD13600 * Lifetime $538.40
10+ $515.40

$513.40
10+ $490.40

No Bid No Bid

4 Center, Easel, Art.  Two Easel Center has plenty of room for art materials on the shelves below 
easels. Each dry-erase panel is adjustable for tray heights between approx. 18-1/8 in and 29-1/2 
in from the floor. Removable trays for easy cleaning. Frame measures 26 1/8" w x 13" d x 49 3/8 
h.  Childcraft 271567 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each Wood Designs WD19350 * Lifetime $486.60
10+ $481.60

$461.60
10+ $456.60

No Bid No Bid

5 Center, Heavy-Duty Magnetic Write & Wipe Big Book.  Wipe-clean laminate center has a display 
stand for books plus a magnetic write and wipe board for high-lighting words, stick on letters and 
more.  Large partitioned storage space in back for  extra Big Books.  Comes with removable 
wheels.  Approx. Size:  15 7/8" deep  x 24" wide x 37 3/4" high.  Lakeshore DG247 or CCSD 
Approved Equivalent.

Each Wood Designs WD54100 * Lifetime $401.50
10+ $395.50

$376.50
10+ $370.50

Kaplan Manufacturing 
#BKDSP96225-40-50

* ** $288.96 $288.96

6 Center, Help Yourself Heavy-Duty.  Four  (4) sturdy staggered shelves to provide space for lots of 
books.  Rugged laminate, with wipe-clean surfaces and rounded corners for safety. Approx. 36" 
wide x 15" deep x 30" high.  Lakeshore DG244 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each Wood Designs C34330F * Lifetime $235.40
10+ $221.40

$210.40
10+ $196.40

Kaplan Manufacturing 
#BKDSP1620-50-50

* ** $273.66 $273.66

7 Center, Double-Sided Mobile Art.  Double-sided easel.  Collaborative and creative sensory station 
is the perfect addition to primary classrooms. Features 2 height-adjustable 27 x 24-inch dry-erase 
painting surfaces, 10 built-in drying racks, 1 sliding really big tub, apron hooks, large art paper 
clips, and 2 removable paint trays with 7 paint pots and spill-proof caps. Four 2-inch locking 
casters included for mobility. Tub measures 13-1/2 W x 25 D x 6 H inches.  The easel has 4 locking 
casters, so you can roll it anywhere—and lock it into place! approx. 27 1/2"w x 29 1/2"d x 51"h.  
Copernicus PDR11 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each   No Bid No Bid Copernicus Educational 
Products #PDR-11

* ** $339.96 $339.96

8 Center, Writing.  Seats 2 students.  All-in-one writing center with lots of storage for materials.  A 
durable hardwood unit that has a compact design to maximize classroom space.  Roomy tabletop 
with laminate surface for easy care..    A recessed shelf on top for extra supplies.  Approx. Size:  36 
1/4" wide x 24" deep x 37 3/4" high.  Lake Shore  JJ726 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each Wood Designs WD99973 * Lifetime $553.60
10+ $541.10

$528.60
10+ $516.10

Kaplan Manufacturing 
#DESK90689-25-100

* ** $280.46 $280.46

9 Center, Writing.  Seats 4 students.  All-in-one writing center with lots of storage for materials.  A 
sturdy hardwood unit with roomy tabletop with laminate surface for easy care.   8 storage 
cubbies that adjust in height.  Approx. Size:  48 5/8" wide x 30" deep x 48" - 56 " high.  Lake Shore  
JJ639 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each Wood Designs WD31120 * Lifetime $789.70
10+ $757.70

$764.70
10+ $732.70

Kaplan Manufacturing 
#DESK60916N-20-50

* ** $434.31 $434.31

10 Chairs, Oak.  To match table (Item #15).  Chair frame and legs to be constructed of solid clear 
hardwood.  Legs to be firmly dadoed into frame underneath the chair.  Natural finish, ladder back 
chairs. Set of 2. Seats are to be solid.  Seat height should be approx. 12".  Jonti-Craft 5912JC or 
CCSD Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  This item will be awarded to the same vendor as #15 below.

Set Wood Designs WD81202 * 10-Year $201.90
10+ $206.90

$186.90
10+ $191.90

No Bid No Bid

Kaplan Early Learning Company
Net 30

MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty
Unit Price

Vendor:
Terms:

Indoff, Incorporated
Net 30

# Description UOM MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty
Unit Price



Tabsheet Cobb County School District
IFB B2234, Kindergarten Furniture

Page 2 of 12

Kaplan Early Learning Company
Net 30

Vendor:
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Delivery to 
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Delivery to 
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Delivery to 
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Warehouse

11 Refrigerator.   Constructed of  hardwood.  Safe hinged design, Warp-proof doors.  Should have 
regular cabinet type handles.  Freezer above, with refrigerator below.  Natural finish.  Approx.  16" 
wide x 11 1/4"deep x 36"high.  Lakeshore LC329 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  This item 
will be awarded to the same vendor as # 12 and 13.

Each Wood Designs WD10400 * Lifetime $337.10
10+ $325.10

$322.10
10+ $325.10

Kaplan Manufacturing 
#KITCH92068N-25-50

* ** $264.31 $264.31

12 Sink. Child's sink unit to be constructed of hardwood with a removable plastic basin.  Faucet 
mounts to allow for easy removal of basin.  To include two simulated taps and mixer faucet.   Unit 
to have large storage cabinet and shelf below.  Safe hinged design.  Should have regular cabinet 
type handles.  Warp-proof doors with magnetic catches.   Approx. size:  19"wide x 11 1/4" deep x 
26" high to counter top.  Natural finish.  Lakeshore LC251 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  
This item will be awarded to the same vendor as # 11 and 13.

Each Wood Designs WD10200 * Lifetime $314.70
10+ $303.70

$303.70
10+ $288.70

Kaplan Manufacturing 
#KITCH92065N-50-50

* ** $211.61 $211.61

13 Stove.   To be constructed of hardwood.   Safe hinged design.  Warp-proof doors.  Should have 
regular cabinet type handles.  Four simulated burners and plastic knobs to turn off and on.  
Natural finish.  Approx. size:  18"wide x 11 1/4"deep x 26"high.  Lakeshore LC327 or CCSD 
Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  This item will be awarded to the same vendor as # 11 and 12.

Each Wood Designs WD10100 * Lifetime $314.70
10+ $303.70

$303.70
10+ $288.70

Kaplan Manufacturing 
#KITCH92066N-50-50

* ** $246.46 $246.46

14 Table, Building Block. Table to provide a sturdy building grid surface.  Four open slots at each side 
of unit provides ample storage for hundreds of mini building bricks and other figurines.  Made of 
wood and tough plastic.  Standard Grid, approx. 32-1/4 W x 32-1/4 D x 24-3/16 H in.  Compatible 
with Lego Duplo Building Bricks.  Childcraft 1357846 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each Wood Designs 
TP3131PGNA1829B

* 10-Year $354.10
10+ $345.10

$334.10
10+ $325.10

No Bid No Bid

15 Table, Round Oak.  Tabletop to be approx. 36" diameter and approx. 24" high.(Seats up to four 
children).  Table frame and legs to be constructed of hardwood.  Table top to have laminate 
surface with a backer sheet to protect the table.  Plastic banding around the edge that matches 
the top and square legs made of hardwood.  Legs must be firmly dadoed into frame underneath 
table top.  Table to be finished with a natural varnish.  Childcraft 1473467 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent. NOTE:  This item will be awarded to the same vendor as #10 above.

Each Wood Designs WD83624 * 10-Year $278.80
10+ $275.80

$258.80
10+ $255.80

No Bid No Bid

16 Table, Sand and Water.  Constructed of soft maple with a plastic tub that has a rubber drain plug.  
Includes a cover.  Casters are located on two legs to allow movement when needed.  Approx. size:  
30 1/8"wide x 42 3/8"long x 23 5/8" high,  Childcraft 306600, or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each Wood Designs WD11865TN * 10-Year $653.60
10+ $527.60

$633.60
10+ $507.60

Kaplan Manufacturing 
#SW15854N-20-50

* ** $467.46 $467.46

Accessories
17 Balance, All-Purpose Classroom.  Balance has roomy buckets with removable lids.  Must be able 

to fill the buckets with hard-to-measure items or place objects on top.  Fully washable buckets 
hold both liquids and solids.  approx. 15" long.  Lakeshore RR414, or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each No Bid No Bid SI Manufacturing LTD 
#92300BY

* ** $13.56 $13.56

18 Beads, Lace-A-Word Lowercase.  Easy-threading beads.  Over 280 plastic beads and 12 plastic-
tipped laces come in a storage tub. Beads are approx.  3/4"-1" tall.
Lakeshore  BD297 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 Beads, Lace-A-Word Uppercase.  Set features approx. 250 uppercase letter beads plus  approx. 
12 long, plastic-tipped laces that provide lots of room to work. In a storage tub; beads are approx. 
7/8" tall.  Lakeshore BD294 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 Blocks, Hollow  – Wooden.  Set of 20.  Approximately 11” x 5-1/2” x 5-1/2”.  School Specialty 
#1539538 or CCSD approved equivalent

Set No Bid No Bid Kaplan Manufacturing 
#BLOCK60320-200-200

* ** $339.96 $339.96

21 Blocks, Hollow  – Wooden.  Set of 40.  Approximately 11” x 5-1/2” x 5-1/2”.  School Specialty 
#1539539 or CCSD approved equivalent

Set No Bid No Bid Kaplan Manufacturing 
#BLOCK60320-200-200x2

* ** $679.96 $679.96

22 Blocks, Mapel Unit.  Starter set that includes 14 shapes, approx. 108 blocks.  Sanded and beveled.  
Basic block size.  Lakeshore B250A or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set No Bid No Bid Kaplan Manufacturing 
#13904

* ** $280.46 $280.46

Unit Price
MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty

Unit Price
MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty# Description UOM
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Delivery to 
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23 Bricks, Building with Container.  Approx. 300 Pieces, Assorted square, square wedges, and 
rectangle building bricks in blue, red, and yellow.  Bricks must work on table listed in Item #14.  
Marvel Education Company 1555935 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 Career Figure Set, Pretend Play.  Made of durable vinyl.  Approx. 12 career workers painted with 
realistic detail.  Figures measure approx.  5" tall. Marvel Education 521456 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent.

Set No Bid No Bid Marvel Education Company 
#MTC-138

* ** $37.36 $37.36

25 Carpet, Alphabet Activity. With squares for every letter, each with upper case and lowercase 
letters,approx. 9 feet x 12 feet.  Lakeshore TT669 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each No Bid No Bid **Sub - 8'x12'   Carpets For 
Kids ETC Inc #96.93

* ** $314.46 $314.46

26 Carpet, A Place for Everyone.  With 30 squares in 5 vibrant colors. Seats up to 30 children, 
approx.  9 feet x 12 feet.  Lakeshore LA952 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each No Bid No Bid **Sub - 7'6"x12"   Carpets 
for Kids ETC Inc #9612

* ** $365.46 $365.46

27 Chart, Pocket.  10  clear pockets to hold cards and strips, sturdy grommets for easy hanging.  
Chart to be made of heavy duty nylon with metal grommets to permit hanging.  Includes carrying 
case for easy storage.  Approx. Size:  34" x 50".  School Smart 200259 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent.

Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 Chart, Pocket Adjustable Stand.  Adjusts from approx. 48" to 78" long and from approx. 42" to 
77" wide. For use of multiple pocket charts and chart tablets or extra wide pocket charts.  Must 
have 5 movable rings.  Pacon Corp 084653 or CCSD Approved Equivalent

Each No Bid No Bid Dixon Ticonderoga 
Company #P0020990

* ** $69.66 $69.66

29 Cups, No-Spill Paint.  Set of 10 assorted colors.  Durable plastic paint cups approx. 4" tall.  
Includes one-piece screw on lids with easy-access hinged tops that flip all the way back and snap 
shut for storage.  Cups wash up easily with soap and water.  Lakeshore LA820x  or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent

Set No Bid No Bid Dixon Ticonderoga 
Company #PAC5100

* ** $13.56 $13.56

30 Dishes, Cooking Set.  School Smart Play Kitchen Dish Pack of approx. 60 pieces of kitchen items 
for cooking, baking, serving and tea time. Set is made of durable plastic.  Lakeshore LA427 or 
CCSD Approved Equivalent

Set No Bid No Bid Learning Resources Inc 
#LER9157

* ** $45.86 $45.86

31 Dishes, Play.  Indestructable, Service for 4. Approx. 20 piece set.  Unbreakable plastic, kid-sized 
cups, plates and utensils.  Lakeshore LDA178 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set No Bid No Bid Learning Resources Inc 
#LER3294

* ** $22.91 $22.91

32 Food, Play.  Approx. 100 plastic pieces in a storage tub.  Realistic play food for breakfast, lunch, 
dinner, snacks and desserts.  Lakeshore LM365 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set No Bid No Bid Step 2 Corporation #896699 * ** $38.21 $38.21

33 Housekeeping Set.  Wood design, housekeeping tools and stand.  Includes:  Corn Broom, Mop, 
Dust Pan, and Hand Sweeper.  Childcraft 074582 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set Wood Designs WD24200 * Lifetime $136.20
10+ 133.20

$126.20
10+ $123.20

Melissa & Doug #8600 * ** $28.01 $28.01

34 Mat, Rest.  Premium 4-Fold.  48” x 24” x 2”; Red/Blue.  Pack of 5.  Childcraft #2026840 or CCSD 
approved equivalent

No Bid No Bid Childrens Factory #CF400-
509RBx5

* ** $178.30 $178.30

35 Storage Caddy.  Set of 6.   Art Caddies in blue, orange, red, yellow, green, and purple. This 3-
compartment caddy is durable and also easy-to-clean. Measures approx. 9-1/4 x 9 1/4 x 3 1/2 
inches.  Lakeshore PP506 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

SET No Bid No Bid **Sub - Does not come in 
assorted colors    Romanoff 

Products Inc #25902x6

* ** $30.36 $30.36

36 Vehicle Bucket Set, International Playthings Chubbies.  Includes cars, trucks, planes, boats, 
helicopters and construction vehicles with sturdy moving parts.  Includes storage pail.  15 pieces.  
International Playthings 082468 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set No Bid No Bid Viking Toys LLC #41140 * ** $42.46 $42.46

# Description UOM MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty
Unit Price

MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty
Unit Price
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Kaplan Early Learning Company
Net 30

Vendor:
Terms:

Indoff, Incorporated
Net 30

#
Related Items

37

Awarded vendors highlighted in yellow
Item did not meet specs
See Explanation of Award in original file

NOTES: *  4-6 weeks ARO; volume orders 6-8 weeks ARO *  7-10 business days if item is in-stock. Please note, due to current worldwide 
supply chain issues, backorder items could take 5-6 months for delivery ARO

**  See "Warranty, Quality, and Return Policies" statement included with 
original response.

% Discount

15% discount applied to current list pricing in effect at time of order. Some 
exclusions apply - See "Exclusions From Our Offer" statement included with 

original response

Per Section 5.9 of the Special Terms & Conditions, in the event CCSD has failed to include an item(s), 
responding vendors are asked to provide a fee structure for additional, related items that may be 
purchased during the award period.   Some example responses are:  X% discount below MSRP; X% 
discount below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up.  

28% off MSRP plus freight and install

% DiscountDescription
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Furniture
1 Audio Station, Mobile Junior  Hardwood unit rolls on casters.  Room on top for CD player and 

junction box plus headphones.  Underneath it has one shelf for storage.  Made of Birch Plywood. 
Approx. 27 3/4"long x  14 3/4" wide x  23 3/4" high. Childcraft 1301528 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent.

Each

2 Cabinet, Storage (2 Shelves).  Three compartment mobile storage cabinet with an open top shelf 
and 2 open sections on the bottom. Heavy-duty casters on the bottom make it easy to move. 
Assembled unit measures 47-3/4 W x 14-1/4 D x 30 H inches.  To be constructed of hardwood 
rounded corner blocks that prevent sharp corners.  Kickboard to surround entire base.  All joints 
to be dadoed and secured by screws.  Childcraft Korners for Kids 272155 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent. 

Each

3 Cabinet, Storage (3 Shelves).  Spacious compartments provide versatile storage for materials of 
all shapes and sizes, while staying within easy reach. To be constructed of hardwood rounded 
corner blocks that prevent sharp corners.  Heavy-duty casters. approx. 47-3/4 in W x 14-1/4 in D x 
36 in H. Childcraft Korners for Kids 249351 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

4 Center, Easel, Art.  Two Easel Center has plenty of room for art materials on the shelves below 
easels. Each dry-erase panel is adjustable for tray heights between approx. 18-1/8 in and 29-1/2 
in from the floor. Removable trays for easy cleaning. Frame measures 26 1/8" w x 13" d x 49 3/8 
h.  Childcraft 271567 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

5 Center, Heavy-Duty Magnetic Write & Wipe Big Book.  Wipe-clean laminate center has a display 
stand for books plus a magnetic write and wipe board for high-lighting words, stick on letters and 
more.  Large partitioned storage space in back for  extra Big Books.  Comes with removable 
wheels.  Approx. Size:  15 7/8" deep  x 24" wide x 37 3/4" high.  Lakeshore DG247 or CCSD 
Approved Equivalent.

Each

6 Center, Help Yourself Heavy-Duty.  Four  (4) sturdy staggered shelves to provide space for lots of 
books.  Rugged laminate, with wipe-clean surfaces and rounded corners for safety. Approx. 36" 
wide x 15" deep x 30" high.  Lakeshore DG244 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

7 Center, Double-Sided Mobile Art.  Double-sided easel.  Collaborative and creative sensory station 
is the perfect addition to primary classrooms. Features 2 height-adjustable 27 x 24-inch dry-erase 
painting surfaces, 10 built-in drying racks, 1 sliding really big tub, apron hooks, large art paper 
clips, and 2 removable paint trays with 7 paint pots and spill-proof caps. Four 2-inch locking 
casters included for mobility. Tub measures 13-1/2 W x 25 D x 6 H inches.  The easel has 4 locking 
casters, so you can roll it anywhere—and lock it into place! approx. 27 1/2"w x 29 1/2"d x 51"h.  
Copernicus PDR11 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

8 Center, Writing.  Seats 2 students.  All-in-one writing center with lots of storage for materials.  A 
durable hardwood unit that has a compact design to maximize classroom space.  Roomy tabletop 
with laminate surface for easy care..    A recessed shelf on top for extra supplies.  Approx. Size:  36 
1/4" wide x 24" deep x 37 3/4" high.  Lake Shore  JJ726 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

9 Center, Writing.  Seats 4 students.  All-in-one writing center with lots of storage for materials.  A 
sturdy hardwood unit with roomy tabletop with laminate surface for easy care.   8 storage 
cubbies that adjust in height.  Approx. Size:  48 5/8" wide x 30" deep x 48" - 56 " high.  Lake Shore  
JJ639 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

10 Chairs, Oak.  To match table (Item #15).  Chair frame and legs to be constructed of solid clear 
hardwood.  Legs to be firmly dadoed into frame underneath the chair.  Natural finish, ladder back 
chairs. Set of 2. Seats are to be solid.  Seat height should be approx. 12".  Jonti-Craft 5912JC or 
CCSD Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  This item will be awarded to the same vendor as #15 below.

Set

Vendor:
Terms:

# Description UOM Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

JJ965  Lakeshore * Lifetime Warranty $284.05 $284.05 Jonti-Craft 8-12 wks * $521.96 $511.96

JJ168  Lakeshore * Lifetime Warranty $341.05 $341.05 Jonti-Craft 0392JC011 8-12 wks * $355.19 $349.45

JJ195  Lakeshore  
(without casters)

* Lifetime Warranty $426.55 $426.55 Jonti-Craft 2691JC011 8-12 wks * $414.56 $410.56

LL329  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $284.05 $284.05 Jonti-Craft 0289JC 8-12 wks * $383.54 $378.54

JJ987  Lakeshore
Please note, Lakeshore DG247 is 

discontinued and JJ987 is an improved 
version of the requested item.

 Out of stock--
ship by 

04/04/22.

Lifetime Warranty $360.05 $360.05 Jonti-Craft 0543JC011 8-12 wks * $338.58 $333.58

DG244  Lakeshore as specified * Lifetime Warranty $331.55 $331.55 Jonti-Craft 1728JC 8-12 wks * $300.92 $295.92

LL329  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $284.05 $284.05 Jonti-Craft 0289JC 8-12 wks * $383.54 $378.54

JJ726  Lakeshore as specified * Lifetime Warranty $455.05 $455.05 Jonti-Craft 9522JC 8-12 wks * $362.88 $357.88

JJ639  Lakeshore  as specified * Lifetime Warranty $550.05 $550.05 Lake Shore JJ639 8-12 wks * $663.67 $653.67

2x JJ322  Lakeshore * Lifetime Warranty $170.98 $170.98 Jonti-Craft 5912JC 8-12 wks 5 year $94.28 $89.28

RA Design Studio LLC
Net 30

MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty
Unit Price

Lakeshore Parent, LLC dba Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC
Net 30

MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty
Unit Price
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Vendor:
Terms:

11 Refrigerator.   Constructed of  hardwood.  Safe hinged design, Warp-proof doors.  Should have 
regular cabinet type handles.  Freezer above, with refrigerator below.  Natural finish.  Approx.  16" 
wide x 11 1/4"deep x 36"high.  Lakeshore LC329 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  This item 
will be awarded to the same vendor as # 12 and 13.

Each

12 Sink. Child's sink unit to be constructed of hardwood with a removable plastic basin.  Faucet 
mounts to allow for easy removal of basin.  To include two simulated taps and mixer faucet.   Unit 
to have large storage cabinet and shelf below.  Safe hinged design.  Should have regular cabinet 
type handles.  Warp-proof doors with magnetic catches.   Approx. size:  19"wide x 11 1/4" deep x 
26" high to counter top.  Natural finish.  Lakeshore LC251 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  
This item will be awarded to the same vendor as # 11 and 13.

Each

13 Stove.   To be constructed of hardwood.   Safe hinged design.  Warp-proof doors.  Should have 
regular cabinet type handles.  Four simulated burners and plastic knobs to turn off and on.  
Natural finish.  Approx. size:  18"wide x 11 1/4"deep x 26"high.  Lakeshore LC327 or CCSD 
Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  This item will be awarded to the same vendor as # 11 and 12.

Each

14 Table, Building Block. Table to provide a sturdy building grid surface.  Four open slots at each side 
of unit provides ample storage for hundreds of mini building bricks and other figurines.  Made of 
wood and tough plastic.  Standard Grid, approx. 32-1/4 W x 32-1/4 D x 24-3/16 H in.  Compatible 
with Lego Duplo Building Bricks.  Childcraft 1357846 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

15 Table, Round Oak.  Tabletop to be approx. 36" diameter and approx. 24" high.(Seats up to four 
children).  Table frame and legs to be constructed of hardwood.  Table top to have laminate 
surface with a backer sheet to protect the table.  Plastic banding around the edge that matches 
the top and square legs made of hardwood.  Legs must be firmly dadoed into frame underneath 
table top.  Table to be finished with a natural varnish.  Childcraft 1473467 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent. NOTE:  This item will be awarded to the same vendor as #10 above.

Each

16 Table, Sand and Water.  Constructed of soft maple with a plastic tub that has a rubber drain plug.  
Includes a cover.  Casters are located on two legs to allow movement when needed.  Approx. size:  
30 1/8"wide x 42 3/8"long x 23 5/8" high,  Childcraft 306600, or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

Accessories
17 Balance, All-Purpose Classroom.  Balance has roomy buckets with removable lids.  Must be able 

to fill the buckets with hard-to-measure items or place objects on top.  Fully washable buckets 
hold both liquids and solids.  approx. 15" long.  Lakeshore RR414, or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

18 Beads, Lace-A-Word Lowercase.  Easy-threading beads.  Over 280 plastic beads and 12 plastic-
tipped laces come in a storage tub. Beads are approx.  3/4"-1" tall.
Lakeshore  BD297 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

19 Beads, Lace-A-Word Uppercase.  Set features approx. 250 uppercase letter beads plus  approx. 
12 long, plastic-tipped laces that provide lots of room to work. In a storage tub; beads are approx. 
7/8" tall.  Lakeshore BD294 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

20 Blocks, Hollow  – Wooden.  Set of 20.  Approximately 11” x 5-1/2” x 5-1/2”.  School Specialty 
#1539538 or CCSD approved equivalent

Set

21 Blocks, Hollow  – Wooden.  Set of 40.  Approximately 11” x 5-1/2” x 5-1/2”.  School Specialty 
#1539539 or CCSD approved equivalent

Set

22 Blocks, Mapel Unit.  Starter set that includes 14 shapes, approx. 108 blocks.  Sanded and beveled.  
Basic block size.  Lakeshore B250A or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

# Description UOM

RA Design Studio LLC
Net 30

Lakeshore Parent, LLC dba Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC
Net 30

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

LC329  Lakeshore  as specified Out of stock--
ship by 

03/06/22

1-Year Warranty $312.55 $312.55 Jonti-Craft 2410JC 8-12 wks * $291.36 $286.36

LC251  Lakeshore  as specified Out of stock--
ship by 4/14/22

1-Year Warranty $312.55 $312.55 Jonti-Craft 2408JC 8-12 wks * $267.38 $262.38

LC327  Lakeshore  as specified Out of stock--
ship by 

02/11/22

1-Year Warranty $265.05 $265.05 Jonti-Craft 2409JC 8-12 wks * $256.37 $251.37

RR326  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $426.55 $426.55 ChildCraft 1357846 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$335.66 $330.66

JJ755  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $331.55 $331.55 Jonti-Craft 6262JCP251 8-12 wks * $289.49 $285.49

JJ631  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $312.55 $312.55 Jonti-Craft 2866JC 8-12 wks * $433.67 $428.67

RR414  Lakeshore as specified * 1-Year Warranty $18.99 $18.99 Lake Shore RR414 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$26.99 $21.59

BD297  Lakeshore as specified * 1-Year Warranty $28.49 $28.49 ChildCraft 205822 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$67.49 $60.49

BD294  Lakeshore as specified * 1-Year Warranty $28.49 $28.49 ChildCraft 205822 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$67.49 $60.49

FF349  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $360.05 $360.05 Jonti-Craft 2641JC 8-12 wks * $722.28 $717.28

2x FF349  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $720.10 $720.10 Jonti-Craft 0262JC 8-12 wks * $968.27 $963.27

B250A  Lakeshore as specified * 50-Year Warranty $322.05 $322.05 Jonti-Craft 0264JC 8-12 wks * $380.54 $375.54

Warranty
Unit Price

MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty
Unit Price

MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time
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Vendor:
Terms:

23 Bricks, Building with Container.  Approx. 300 Pieces, Assorted square, square wedges, and 
rectangle building bricks in blue, red, and yellow.  Bricks must work on table listed in Item #14.  
Marvel Education Company 1555935 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

24 Career Figure Set, Pretend Play.  Made of durable vinyl.  Approx. 12 career workers painted with 
realistic detail.  Figures measure approx.  5" tall. Marvel Education 521456 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent.

Set

25 Carpet, Alphabet Activity. With squares for every letter, each with upper case and lowercase 
letters,approx. 9 feet x 12 feet.  Lakeshore TT669 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

26 Carpet, A Place for Everyone.  With 30 squares in 5 vibrant colors. Seats up to 30 children, 
approx.  9 feet x 12 feet.  Lakeshore LA952 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

27 Chart, Pocket.  10  clear pockets to hold cards and strips, sturdy grommets for easy hanging.  
Chart to be made of heavy duty nylon with metal grommets to permit hanging.  Includes carrying 
case for easy storage.  Approx. Size:  34" x 50".  School Smart 200259 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent.

Each

28 Chart, Pocket Adjustable Stand.  Adjusts from approx. 48" to 78" long and from approx. 42" to 
77" wide. For use of multiple pocket charts and chart tablets or extra wide pocket charts.  Must 
have 5 movable rings.  Pacon Corp 084653 or CCSD Approved Equivalent

Each

29 Cups, No-Spill Paint.  Set of 10 assorted colors.  Durable plastic paint cups approx. 4" tall.  
Includes one-piece screw on lids with easy-access hinged tops that flip all the way back and snap 
shut for storage.  Cups wash up easily with soap and water.  Lakeshore LA820x  or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent

Set

30 Dishes, Cooking Set.  School Smart Play Kitchen Dish Pack of approx. 60 pieces of kitchen items 
for cooking, baking, serving and tea time. Set is made of durable plastic.  Lakeshore LA427 or 
CCSD Approved Equivalent

Set

31 Dishes, Play.  Indestructable, Service for 4. Approx. 20 piece set.  Unbreakable plastic, kid-sized 
cups, plates and utensils.  Lakeshore LDA178 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

32 Food, Play.  Approx. 100 plastic pieces in a storage tub.  Realistic play food for breakfast, lunch, 
dinner, snacks and desserts.  Lakeshore LM365 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

33 Housekeeping Set.  Wood design, housekeeping tools and stand.  Includes:  Corn Broom, Mop, 
Dust Pan, and Hand Sweeper.  Childcraft 074582 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

34 Mat, Rest.  Premium 4-Fold.  48” x 24” x 2”; Red/Blue.  Pack of 5.  Childcraft #2026840 or CCSD 
approved equivalent

35 Storage Caddy.  Set of 6.   Art Caddies in blue, orange, red, yellow, green, and purple. This 3-
compartment caddy is durable and also easy-to-clean. Measures approx. 9-1/4 x 9 1/4 x 3 1/2 
inches.  Lakeshore PP506 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

SET

36 Vehicle Bucket Set, International Playthings Chubbies.  Includes cars, trucks, planes, boats, 
helicopters and construction vehicles with sturdy moving parts.  Includes storage pail.  15 pieces.  
International Playthings 082468 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

# Description UOM

RA Design Studio LLC
Net 30

Lakeshore Parent, LLC dba Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC
Net 30

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

RA182  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $66.49 $66.49 ChildCraft 1539535 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$122.13 $112.13

RR653  Lakeshore * 10-Year Warranty $37.99 $37.99 ChildCraft 521456 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$51.58 $45.82

TT669  Lakeshore as specified * 10-Year Warranty $521.55 $521.55 ChildCraft 521197 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$600.03 $595.15

LA952   Lakeshore as specified * 10-Year Warranty $521.55 $521.55 ChildCraft 5003035 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$501.75 $496.75

LK297BU  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $23.74 $23.74 ChildCraft 200259 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$52.12 $47.12

LA964  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $66.49 $66.49 ChildCraft 1301528 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$100.06 $95.58

LA820X  Lakeshore as specified * 1-Year Warranty $16.14 $16.14 ChildCraft 1572404 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$33.35 $27.85

LA427  Lakeshore as specified * 1-Year Warranty $37.99 $37.99 Lake Shore LA427 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$53.99 $47.19

LDA178  Lakeshore as specified * 1-Year Warranty $18.99 $18.99 Lake Shore LDA178 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$26.99 $21.59

LM365  Lakeshore as specified * 1-Year Warranty $47.49 $47.49 Lake Shore LM365 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$67.49 $61.49

LC55X  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $104.48 $104.48 Jonti-Craft 8-12 wks * $110.40 $105.40

5x LC193  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $208.95 $208.95 Child Craft 2026840 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$230.54 $225.54

PP506  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $37.99 $37.99 Child Craft 1537255 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$27.30 $22.70

DC411  Lakeshore * 1-Year Warranty $47.49 $47.49 Child Craft 76536 8-12 wks Offers a lifetime 
guarantee again

$44.69 $39.02

MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty
Unit Price

MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty
Unit Price
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Vendor:
Terms:

#
Related Items

37

Awarded vendors highlighted in yellow
Item did not meet specs
See Explanation of Award in original file

NOTES:

Per Section 5.9 of the Special Terms & Conditions, in the event CCSD has failed to include an item(s), 
responding vendors are asked to provide a fee structure for additional, related items that may be 
purchased during the award period.   Some example responses are:  X% discount below MSRP; X% 
discount below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up.  

Description

RA Design Studio LLC
Net 30

Lakeshore Parent, LLC dba Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC
Net 30

*  7-21 Business Days ARO *  See warranty information included with original response

% Discount

25% discount below MSRP

% Discount

Lakeshore is offering Cobb County School District, a 5% discount on all non-sale items in Lakeshore's 
catalogs and online. 
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Furniture
1 Audio Station, Mobile Junior  Hardwood unit rolls on casters.  Room on top for CD player and 

junction box plus headphones.  Underneath it has one shelf for storage.  Made of Birch Plywood. 
Approx. 27 3/4"long x  14 3/4" wide x  23 3/4" high. Childcraft 1301528 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent.

Each

2 Cabinet, Storage (2 Shelves).  Three compartment mobile storage cabinet with an open top shelf 
and 2 open sections on the bottom. Heavy-duty casters on the bottom make it easy to move. 
Assembled unit measures 47-3/4 W x 14-1/4 D x 30 H inches.  To be constructed of hardwood 
rounded corner blocks that prevent sharp corners.  Kickboard to surround entire base.  All joints 
to be dadoed and secured by screws.  Childcraft Korners for Kids 272155 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent. 

Each

3 Cabinet, Storage (3 Shelves).  Spacious compartments provide versatile storage for materials of 
all shapes and sizes, while staying within easy reach. To be constructed of hardwood rounded 
corner blocks that prevent sharp corners.  Heavy-duty casters. approx. 47-3/4 in W x 14-1/4 in D x 
36 in H. Childcraft Korners for Kids 249351 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

4 Center, Easel, Art.  Two Easel Center has plenty of room for art materials on the shelves below 
easels. Each dry-erase panel is adjustable for tray heights between approx. 18-1/8 in and 29-1/2 
in from the floor. Removable trays for easy cleaning. Frame measures 26 1/8" w x 13" d x 49 3/8 
h.  Childcraft 271567 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

5 Center, Heavy-Duty Magnetic Write & Wipe Big Book.  Wipe-clean laminate center has a display 
stand for books plus a magnetic write and wipe board for high-lighting words, stick on letters and 
more.  Large partitioned storage space in back for  extra Big Books.  Comes with removable 
wheels.  Approx. Size:  15 7/8" deep  x 24" wide x 37 3/4" high.  Lakeshore DG247 or CCSD 
Approved Equivalent.

Each

6 Center, Help Yourself Heavy-Duty.  Four  (4) sturdy staggered shelves to provide space for lots of 
books.  Rugged laminate, with wipe-clean surfaces and rounded corners for safety. Approx. 36" 
wide x 15" deep x 30" high.  Lakeshore DG244 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

7 Center, Double-Sided Mobile Art.  Double-sided easel.  Collaborative and creative sensory station 
is the perfect addition to primary classrooms. Features 2 height-adjustable 27 x 24-inch dry-erase 
painting surfaces, 10 built-in drying racks, 1 sliding really big tub, apron hooks, large art paper 
clips, and 2 removable paint trays with 7 paint pots and spill-proof caps. Four 2-inch locking 
casters included for mobility. Tub measures 13-1/2 W x 25 D x 6 H inches.  The easel has 4 locking 
casters, so you can roll it anywhere—and lock it into place! approx. 27 1/2"w x 29 1/2"d x 51"h.  
Copernicus PDR11 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

8 Center, Writing.  Seats 2 students.  All-in-one writing center with lots of storage for materials.  A 
durable hardwood unit that has a compact design to maximize classroom space.  Roomy tabletop 
with laminate surface for easy care..    A recessed shelf on top for extra supplies.  Approx. Size:  36 
1/4" wide x 24" deep x 37 3/4" high.  Lake Shore  JJ726 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

9 Center, Writing.  Seats 4 students.  All-in-one writing center with lots of storage for materials.  A 
sturdy hardwood unit with roomy tabletop with laminate surface for easy care.   8 storage 
cubbies that adjust in height.  Approx. Size:  48 5/8" wide x 30" deep x 48" - 56 " high.  Lake Shore  
JJ639 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

10 Chairs, Oak.  To match table (Item #15).  Chair frame and legs to be constructed of solid clear 
hardwood.  Legs to be firmly dadoed into frame underneath the chair.  Natural finish, ladder back 
chairs. Set of 2. Seats are to be solid.  Seat height should be approx. 12".  Jonti-Craft 5912JC or 
CCSD Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  This item will be awarded to the same vendor as #15 below.

Set

Vendor:
Terms:

# Description UOM Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Childcraft 1301528 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $99.34 $94.37

Childcraft 272155 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $187.85 $178.46

Childcraft 249351 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $220.72 $209.68

Childcraft 271567 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $203.37 $193.20

Childcraft 204150 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $221.46 $210.39

Childcraft 1526415 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $117.34 $111.47

Copernicus PDR11 - SSL 
#411288

6-8 Weeks Lifetime warranty on easel 
components and tubs.  5 year 

warranty on markerboard

$273.45 $259.78

Childcraft 1301526 6-8 Weeks $268.58 $255.15

Childcraft 071978 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $296.80 $281.96

Jonti-Craft 5912JC2 - SSL 
2026785

6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $118.15 $112.24

School Specialty, LLC
Net 30

MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty
Unit Price
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Vendor:
Terms:

11 Refrigerator.   Constructed of  hardwood.  Safe hinged design, Warp-proof doors.  Should have 
regular cabinet type handles.  Freezer above, with refrigerator below.  Natural finish.  Approx.  16" 
wide x 11 1/4"deep x 36"high.  Lakeshore LC329 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  This item 
will be awarded to the same vendor as # 12 and 13.

Each

12 Sink. Child's sink unit to be constructed of hardwood with a removable plastic basin.  Faucet 
mounts to allow for easy removal of basin.  To include two simulated taps and mixer faucet.   Unit 
to have large storage cabinet and shelf below.  Safe hinged design.  Should have regular cabinet 
type handles.  Warp-proof doors with magnetic catches.   Approx. size:  19"wide x 11 1/4" deep x 
26" high to counter top.  Natural finish.  Lakeshore LC251 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  
This item will be awarded to the same vendor as # 11 and 13.

Each

13 Stove.   To be constructed of hardwood.   Safe hinged design.  Warp-proof doors.  Should have 
regular cabinet type handles.  Four simulated burners and plastic knobs to turn off and on.  
Natural finish.  Approx. size:  18"wide x 11 1/4"deep x 26"high.  Lakeshore LC327 or CCSD 
Approved Equivalent.  NOTE:  This item will be awarded to the same vendor as # 11 and 12.

Each

14 Table, Building Block. Table to provide a sturdy building grid surface.  Four open slots at each side 
of unit provides ample storage for hundreds of mini building bricks and other figurines.  Made of 
wood and tough plastic.  Standard Grid, approx. 32-1/4 W x 32-1/4 D x 24-3/16 H in.  Compatible 
with Lego Duplo Building Bricks.  Childcraft 1357846 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

15 Table, Round Oak.  Tabletop to be approx. 36" diameter and approx. 24" high.(Seats up to four 
children).  Table frame and legs to be constructed of hardwood.  Table top to have laminate 
surface with a backer sheet to protect the table.  Plastic banding around the edge that matches 
the top and square legs made of hardwood.  Legs must be firmly dadoed into frame underneath 
table top.  Table to be finished with a natural varnish.  Childcraft 1473467 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent. NOTE:  This item will be awarded to the same vendor as #10 above.

Each

16 Table, Sand and Water.  Constructed of soft maple with a plastic tub that has a rubber drain plug.  
Includes a cover.  Casters are located on two legs to allow movement when needed.  Approx. size:  
30 1/8"wide x 42 3/8"long x 23 5/8" high,  Childcraft 306600, or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

Accessories
17 Balance, All-Purpose Classroom.  Balance has roomy buckets with removable lids.  Must be able 

to fill the buckets with hard-to-measure items or place objects on top.  Fully washable buckets 
hold both liquids and solids.  approx. 15" long.  Lakeshore RR414, or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

18 Beads, Lace-A-Word Lowercase.  Easy-threading beads.  Over 280 plastic beads and 12 plastic-
tipped laces come in a storage tub. Beads are approx.  3/4"-1" tall.
Lakeshore  BD297 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

19 Beads, Lace-A-Word Uppercase.  Set features approx. 250 uppercase letter beads plus  approx. 
12 long, plastic-tipped laces that provide lots of room to work. In a storage tub; beads are approx. 
7/8" tall.  Lakeshore BD294 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

20 Blocks, Hollow  – Wooden.  Set of 20.  Approximately 11” x 5-1/2” x 5-1/2”.  School Specialty 
#1539538 or CCSD approved equivalent

Set

21 Blocks, Hollow  – Wooden.  Set of 40.  Approximately 11” x 5-1/2” x 5-1/2”.  School Specialty 
#1539539 or CCSD approved equivalent

Set

22 Blocks, Mapel Unit.  Starter set that includes 14 shapes, approx. 108 blocks.  Sanded and beveled.  
Basic block size.  Lakeshore B250A or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

# Description UOM

School Specialty, LLC
Net 30

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Childcraft 250143 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $171.86 $163.27

Childcraft 250116 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $146.23 $138.92

Childcraft 250146 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $148.51 $141.08

Childcraft 249480 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $182.08 $172.98

Childcraft 1473467 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $193.40 $183.73

Childcraft 306600 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $367.74 $349.35

Learning Resources 
LER1521 - SSL 078233

2-4 Weeks 1 Year $14.67 $13.94

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

School Specialty 1539538 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $418.36 $397.44

School Specialty 1539539 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $836.73 $794.89

Childcraft 1401498 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $183.97 $174.77

Unit Price
MFG's Name and Model # Lead-Time Warranty
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Vendor:
Terms:

23 Bricks, Building with Container.  Approx. 300 Pieces, Assorted square, square wedges, and 
rectangle building bricks in blue, red, and yellow.  Bricks must work on table listed in Item #14.  
Marvel Education Company 1555935 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

24 Career Figure Set, Pretend Play.  Made of durable vinyl.  Approx. 12 career workers painted with 
realistic detail.  Figures measure approx.  5" tall. Marvel Education 521456 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent.

Set

25 Carpet, Alphabet Activity. With squares for every letter, each with upper case and lowercase 
letters,approx. 9 feet x 12 feet.  Lakeshore TT669 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

26 Carpet, A Place for Everyone.  With 30 squares in 5 vibrant colors. Seats up to 30 children, 
approx.  9 feet x 12 feet.  Lakeshore LA952 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Each

27 Chart, Pocket.  10  clear pockets to hold cards and strips, sturdy grommets for easy hanging.  
Chart to be made of heavy duty nylon with metal grommets to permit hanging.  Includes carrying 
case for easy storage.  Approx. Size:  34" x 50".  School Smart 200259 or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent.

Each

28 Chart, Pocket Adjustable Stand.  Adjusts from approx. 48" to 78" long and from approx. 42" to 
77" wide. For use of multiple pocket charts and chart tablets or extra wide pocket charts.  Must 
have 5 movable rings.  Pacon Corp 084653 or CCSD Approved Equivalent

Each

29 Cups, No-Spill Paint.  Set of 10 assorted colors.  Durable plastic paint cups approx. 4" tall.  
Includes one-piece screw on lids with easy-access hinged tops that flip all the way back and snap 
shut for storage.  Cups wash up easily with soap and water.  Lakeshore LA820x  or CCSD Approved 
Equivalent

Set

30 Dishes, Cooking Set.  School Smart Play Kitchen Dish Pack of approx. 60 pieces of kitchen items 
for cooking, baking, serving and tea time. Set is made of durable plastic.  Lakeshore LA427 or 
CCSD Approved Equivalent

Set

31 Dishes, Play.  Indestructable, Service for 4. Approx. 20 piece set.  Unbreakable plastic, kid-sized 
cups, plates and utensils.  Lakeshore LDA178 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

32 Food, Play.  Approx. 100 plastic pieces in a storage tub.  Realistic play food for breakfast, lunch, 
dinner, snacks and desserts.  Lakeshore LM365 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

33 Housekeeping Set.  Wood design, housekeeping tools and stand.  Includes:  Corn Broom, Mop, 
Dust Pan, and Hand Sweeper.  Childcraft 074582 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

34 Mat, Rest.  Premium 4-Fold.  48” x 24” x 2”; Red/Blue.  Pack of 5.  Childcraft #2026840 or CCSD 
approved equivalent

35 Storage Caddy.  Set of 6.   Art Caddies in blue, orange, red, yellow, green, and purple. This 3-
compartment caddy is durable and also easy-to-clean. Measures approx. 9-1/4 x 9 1/4 x 3 1/2 
inches.  Lakeshore PP506 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

SET

36 Vehicle Bucket Set, International Playthings Chubbies.  Includes cars, trucks, planes, boats, 
helicopters and construction vehicles with sturdy moving parts.  Includes storage pail.  15 pieces.  
International Playthings 082468 or CCSD Approved Equivalent.

Set

# Description UOM

School Specialty, LLC
Net 30

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Marvel Education MTC-
5046 - SSL #1555935

2-4 Weeks 1 Year $57.89 $55.00

Marvel Education MTC-138 - 
SSL #521456

2-4 Weeks 1 Year $25.37 $24.10

Childcraft 5004713 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $292.52 $277.89

Childcraft 5000242 6-8 Weeks Limited Lifetime $295.87 $281.08

School Smart 200259 2-4 Weeks 1 Year $11.53 $10.74

Pacon P0020990 - SSL 
#084653

2-4 Weeks 1 Year $40.83 $38.79

Dixon PAC5100 - SSL 
#430001

2-4 Weeks 1 Year $4.61 $4.38

School Specialty #067739 2-4 Weeks 1 Year $38.99 $37.04

Learning Resources 
LER0294 - SSL #367488

2-4 Weeks 1 Year $13.97 $13.27

Learning Resources 
LER9733 - SSL #1565980

2-4 Weeks 1 Year $51.19 $48.63

Jonti Craft 2061JC - SSL 
#502609

2-4 Weeks 1 Year $106.21 $100.90

Childcraft 2026840 2-4 Weeks 1 Year $128.91 $122.46

School Specialty 1537255 2-4 Weeks 1 Year $11.83 $11.24

School Specialty 2010324 - 
Set of 9

2-4 Weeks 1 Year $15.93 $15.13

Lead-Time Warranty
Unit Price

MFG's Name and Model #
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Vendor:
Terms:

#
Related Items

37

Awarded vendors highlighted in yellow
Item did not meet specs
See Explanation of Award in original file

NOTES:

Per Section 5.9 of the Special Terms & Conditions, in the event CCSD has failed to include an item(s), 
responding vendors are asked to provide a fee structure for additional, related items that may be 
purchased during the award period.   Some example responses are:  X% discount below MSRP; X% 
discount below published catalog pricing; Cost plus X% mark-up.  

Description

School Specialty, LLC
Net 30

% Discount

36% discount off Supplies with free shipping and 25% off Furniture and Equipment with standard shipping 
fees off School Specialty's List price
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