

Vendor: Terms:				DeKalb Office Net 30						Ernie Morris Enterprises, Inc. Net 30					
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
<b>Instructional Areas (commodity codes 42521, 42528, 47045)</b>															
1	Collaboration table, wavy half circle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949AMB-8600	MOORE CO: Creator table, Model # 16XXNX	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$198.82 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DTT-NB3054E	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$215.00
2	Collaboration table, wavy rectangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949UND-8600	MOORE CO: Creator table, Model # 16XXQX	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$201.54 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DTT-EX3054E	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$215.00
3	Collaboration table, wavy square, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949Plaque-8600	MOORE CO: Creator table, Model # 16XXMX	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$186.96 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DTT-NV60E	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$289.00
4	Collaboration table, wavy, triangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949Polygon-8600	MOORE CO: Creator table, Model # 16XXKX	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$201.54 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DTT-GV50E	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$250.00
5	Planner Studio Table 36"x72"x36"H, Butcher block top, casters	Smith System	25214BUTCHER	VANERUM STUDIO- 36Hx72 BUTCHER BLOCK with tutor base, Q18-VAN-1008G1	10 wks	10 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$2118.50 *freight add'l						No Bid
6	Planner Maker Table, 30"x60"x22-32"H	Smith System	24552												No Bid
7	Elemental 60" 6-Star Table. 21.5" - 35.5" H, casters	Smith System	EL6S60 EA	MOORE CO, ACUTE CLOVER 60", TB.ACC.CV.6060.7CM	10 wks	10 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$616.60 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DTT-ST60E	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$288.00
8	Table, Rectangle, 30x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3060-8600C	MOORE CO, ACUTE 3060 RECTANGLE/CASTERS, TA.ACC.R.6030.7CM	10 wks	10 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$446.48 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DTT-RC3060E	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$204.00
9	Table, Rectangle, 30x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3072-8600C	MOORE CO, ACUTE 3072 RECTANGLE/CASTERS, TA.ACC.R.7230.7CM	10 wks	10 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$489.61 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DTT-3072E	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$219.00
10	Table, Rectangle, 24x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C	MOORE CO, ACUTE 2460 RECTANGLE/CASTERS, TA.ACC.R.6024.7CM	10 wks	10 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$421.84 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DTT-2460E	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$196.00
11	Table, Rectangle, 24x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C	MOORE CO, ACUTE 2472 RECTANGLE/CASTERS, TA.ACC.R.7224.7CM	10 wks	10 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$458.78 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DTT-2472E	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$210.00
12	Table, 36" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD36-8600C	MOORE CO, ACUTE 36"ROUND/CASTERS, TB.ACC.RD.3636.7CM	10 wks	10 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$450.46 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DTT-RC36E	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$147.00
13	Table, 48" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD48-8600C	MOORE CO, ACUTE 48" ROUND/CASTERS, TA.ACC.RD.4848.7CM	10 wks	10 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$477.43 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DTT-RD48E	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$191.00
14	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU	MOORE CO, HIERARCHY 18" 4LEG GLIDES, 53318	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$57.86 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL AS4L18	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$46.00
15	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, casters	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU	MOORE CO, HIERARCHY 18" 4LEG CASTERS, 54318	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$85.84 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL AS4C18	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$60.00
16	Café Stool, fixed height, 24", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5824JU	MOORE CO, HIERARCHY 24" STOOL, 53220	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$106.09 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL AS4ST24	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$78.00
17	Café Stool, fixed height, 30", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5830JU	MOORE CO, HIERARCHY 30" STOOL, 53221	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$111.11 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL AS4ST30	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$80.00
18	Active seating, Oodle stool, 17" diameter throughout, 3 interlocking pieces	SmithSystem	OODLE31	MOORE CO, DOTS FLAT STACKABLE, 97F1	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$139.55 *freight add'l						No Bid
19	Instructor mobile podium, collaborative top, no basket, height adjustable	Smith System Sit-Stand Desk	26548V	MOORE CO, UPRITE HARMONY, 90532-G	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$258.97 *freight add'l	HASKELL FZPN7G	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	YES	\$375.00
20	Active seating, balancing stool, 18"	Mien	J4F-3530	MOORE CO, GROW STOOLS 14" 18", 50960	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$88.86 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL ASMOV18	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$81.00
21	Active seating, balancing stool, 21"	Mien	J4F-3530	MOORE CO, GROW STOOLS 18" 24", 50970	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$88.86 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL ASMOV20	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$81.00
22	Café table, 36" round, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01504/01453	MOORE CO, FREQUENCY TABLE 36" RD, TB.FRG.X.RD.3636.42.7	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$457.15 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DCT-RD36F/DCBR-2442	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$235.00
23	Café table, 36" square, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01503/01453	MOORE CO, FREQUENCY TABLE 36" SQ, TB.FRG.X.R.3636.42.7	2-4 wks	2-4 wks	12 yrs	Yes	\$624.40 *freight add'l	ARTCO BELL DCT-SQ36F/DCBR-2442	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	\$235.00



Vendor: Terms:				DeKalb Office Net 30						Ernie Morris Enterprises, Inc. Net 30					
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
4	Clarus								40% off list	GLASSBOARDS - MOBILE AND WALL MOUNTED	4-5 wks	4-6 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	NO	22%
5	Community								46% off list	SOFT SEATING, TABLES, CHAIRS, STOOLS	4-5 wks	5-6 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	NO	45%
6	ECA														
7	ERG International								40% off list	SOFT SEATING, TABLES, CHAIRS, STOOLS	4-5 wks	5-6 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	NO	43%
8	HON									SOFT SEATING, TABLES, CHAIRS, STOOLS	4-5 wks	5-6 wks	LIFETIME	YES	56%
9	Indiana								50% off list						No Bid
10	JSI								46% off list	SOFT SEATING, TABLES, CHAIRS, STOOLS	4-5 wks	5-6 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	NO	53%
11	KI								36% off list	SOFT SEATING, TABLES, CHAIRS, STOOLS	4-5 wks	5-6 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	YES	41%
12	Lacasse								49% off list						No Bid
13	Logiflex								46% off list						No Bid
14	Media Technologies									SOFT SEATING, TABLES, CHAIRS, STOOLS, SHEVLING, CIRCULATION DESKS	6-8 wks	8-10 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	NO	46%
15	Safco								46% off list	SOFT SEATING, TABLES, CHAIRS, STOOLS, MOBILE MARKERBOARDS	4-5 wks	5-6 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	NO	
16	Scholarcraft														No Bid
17	Sit On It								48% off list	SEATING	3-4 wks	4-5 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	NO	51%
18	SmithSystems					4-6 wks	6-8 wks		36% off list						No Bid
19	Steelcase					4-6 wks	4-6 wks	Ltd. lifetime/lifetime depending on product	47% off list						No Bid
20	Steelcase Thread					5-7 wks	5-7 wks	Ltd. lifetime	43% off list						No Bid

Vendor:				DeKalb Office						Ernie Morris Enterprises, Inc.					
Terms:				Net 30						Net 30					
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
21	TenJam									SOFT SEATING	4-5 wks	4-5 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	NO	41%
22	Tesco														No Bid
23	VS							20% off list plus international freight		SEATING, TABLES	10-12 wks	12-14 wks	10 yrs	YES	22%
<b>List any additional manufacturer's discount below</b>															
	Artco Bell									All Products	4-5 wks	4-5 wks	LIFETIME	YES	50%
	Academia														
	Atlona														
	Arold														
	Alumni														
	Burroughs									Metal Shelving	4-6 wks	5-6 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	NO	31%
	Carpet for Kids									Primary Rugs	4-5 wks	4-5 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	YES	20%
	ESI														
	Ghent														
	Haskell									All Products	4-5 wks	4-5 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	YES	45%
	Hon Smartlink														
	HON Build Tables														
	Hon Motivate tables														
	Hon Motivate Seating														
	Learniture														
	Magnusson Group														
	MooreCo									All Products	4-5 wks	4-5 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	YES	41%
	National Office Furniture									All Products	4-5 wks	4-5 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	YES	52%
	Office Master														
	OFM														
	Paragaon									All Products	4-5 wks	5-6 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	YES	38%
	Palmiere Furniture														
	Roland														
	Virco														
	Fomcore									All Products	4-5 wks	4-5 wks	Ltd. LIFETIME	YES	30%

Vendor:				DeKalb Office						Ernie Morris Enterprises, Inc.					
Terms:				Net 30						Net 30					
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
	Allseating														
	Global														
	ESI														
	Berco														
	Mayline														
	Egan														
Notes: The awarded categories are highlighted.															

Vendor: Georgia Specialty Equipment, LLC				Krueger International, Inc.											
Terms: Net 30				Net 30											
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
<b>Instructional Areas (commodity codes 42521, 42528, 47045)</b>															
1	Collaboration table, wavy half circle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart - 60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949AMB-8600		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$218.00						
2	Collaboration table, wavy rectangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart - 60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949UND-8600		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$218.00						
3	Collaboration table, wavy square, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949Plaque-8600		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$243.00						
4	Collaboration table, wavy, triangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949Polygon-8600		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$218.00						
5	Planner Studio Table 36"x72"x36"H, Butcher block top, casters	Smith System	25214BUTCHER		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$871.00						
6	Planner Maker Table, 30"x60"x22-32"H	Smith System	24552		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$557.00						
7	Elemental 60" 6-Star Table. 21.5" - 35.5" H, casters	Smith System	EL6S60 EA	Scholarcraft FS949STAR-8600C	4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$297.00						
8	Table, Rectangle, 30x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3060-8600C		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$215.00	KI (Oxford) O255/ACH (\$18215583)	4 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	Lifetime	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 233.82
9	Table, Rectangle, 30x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3072-8600C		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$217.00	KI (Oxford) O256/ACH (\$18215585)	4 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	Lifetime	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 248.40
10	Table, Rectangle, 24x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$213.00	KI (Oxford) O255/ACH (\$18215587)	4 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	Lifetime	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 191.70
11	Table, Rectangle, 24x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$216.00	KI (Oxford) O256/ACH (\$18215588)	4 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	Lifetime	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 200.88
12	Table, 36" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD36-8600C		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$230.00	KI (Oxford) OR3/ACH (\$18215592)	4 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	Lifetime	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 220.32
13	Table, 48" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD48-8600C		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$245.00	KI (Oxford) OR4/ACH (\$18215595)	4 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	Lifetime	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 258.66
14	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$44.50	KI (Intellect Wave) IW418	4 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	15 yrs	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 64.26
15	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, casters	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$61.70	KI (Intellect Wave) IW418C	5 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	15 yrs	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 93.96
16	Café Stool, fixed height, 24", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5824JU		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$142.50	KI - IWCS24	5 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	15 yrs	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 145.80
17	Café Stool, fixed height, 30", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5830JU		4-5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$144.80	KI (Intellect Wave) IWCS30	5 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	15 yrs	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 151.74
18	Active seating, Oodle stool, 17" diameter throughout, 3 interlocking pieces	SmithSystem	OODLE31		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$104.25						
19	Instructor mobile podium, collaborative top, no basket, height adjustable	Smith System Sit-Stand Desk	26548V		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$460.00	KI (Rukus) RUW20E	4 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	15 yrs	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 471.42
20	Active seating, balancing stool, 18"	Mien	J4F-3530		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$84.50						
21	Active seating, balancing stool, 21"	Mien	J4F-3530		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$87.00						
22	Café table, 36" round, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01504/01453		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$287.00	KI (Portico) PR3FX-74P	3 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	Lifetime	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 420.66
23	Café table, 36" square, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01503/01453		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$289.00	KI (Portico) PS3FX-74P	3 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	Lifetime	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 401.76

Vendor: Georgia Specialty Equipment, LLC				Krueger International, Inc.											
Terms: Net 30				Net 30											
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
24	Café table, 42" round, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01506/01457		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$349.00	KI (Portico) PR35FX-74P	3 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	Lifetime	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 547.56
25	Café table, 42" square, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01505/01457		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$352.00	KI (Portico) PS35FX-74P	3 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	Lifetime	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 547.56
26	Flat surface power module add on for Café tables, 2 USB, 1 AC port	SmithSystem	17098		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$138.00	KI (Module) ASH2UO.8	4 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	15 yrs	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 125.82
27	Power Tower with USB and AC charging access, 42" H, casters	Mooreco	27735		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$282.00	KI (All Terrain) ATS43666FHC/MB	4 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	Lifetime	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 495.18
28	Mobile whiteboard, 36" x 88", casters	Safeco	2016WBS		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$327.00						
29	Flex Charge Table Top Power Unit - FlexCharge4. 2 AC outlets; 2 quick-charge USB outlet. 8 foot cord	Flex Charge	FCH4-DSK-WHT		3 wks	3 wks	5 yr	No	\$110.00						
30	Flex Charge Table Top Power Unit - FlexCharge9. 5 AC outlets; 4 quick-charge USB outlets. 8 foot cord	Flex Charge	FCH9-POD-WHT		3 wks	3 wks	5 yr	No	\$138.00						
<b>Individual Area (commodity code 42084)</b>															
1	Node Desk - Tripod base with casters, swivel seat, movable worksurface	Steelcase Node Desk		KI#L2WTP/FBR	4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	YES	\$348.00	KI (Learn2) - L2WTP/FBR	5 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	15 yrs	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 319.68
<b>Collaboration Station (commodity code 71560)</b>															
1	Multimedia Table, 4 student, (2 pwr, 4 USB) w/casters and display mount	SmithSystem	4161		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$580.00						
2	Multimedia Table, 6 student, (4 pwr, 8 USB) w/casters and display mount	SmithSystem	4138		4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	\$944.00						
3	LED Commercial Display, 43", w/ 2 yr warranty, PC input		SmithSystem 04138												
4	4 Input HDMI switcher	AT-HD4-V41													
5	6 input HDMI switcher with toggle switch control														
6	HDMI cabling for each student and display		Atlona AT-HD4-V41												
7	VGA/audio to HDMI converters														
8	VGA/audio cabling														
9	Lightning to HDMI adapters														
<b>Shelving (No substitution of mfg) (commodity code 42052)</b>															
1	Double-sided mobile shelving, 36"w x 42"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart		RP5991S07	8 wks	10 wks	25 yrs	YES	\$ 780.00	KI (Rukus) - RKB362436	4 wks	TBD: likely 1-2 additional wks	15 yrs	No (SCS Indoor Advantage Gold)	\$ 578.34
2	Double-sided mobile shelving, 36"w x 48"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart		RP5776S07	8 wks	10 wks	25 yrs	YES	\$ 826.00						
3	Double-sided mobile shelving, 36"w x 60"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart		RP5986S07	8 wks	10 wks	25 yrs	YES	\$ 1,025.00						
4	Double-sided mobile shelving, 72"w x 42"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart		RP5991S08	8 wks	10 wks	25 yrs	YES	\$ 1,369.00						
5	Double-sided mobile shelving, 72"w x 48"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart		RP5766S08	8 wks	10 wks	25 yrs	YES	\$ 1,460.00						
6	Double-sided mobile shelving, 72"w x 60"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart		RP5986S08	8 wks	10 wks	25 yrs	YES	\$ 1,810.00						
7	Single-sided mobile radius shelving, 66"w x 42 "H, curved, all laminate	Brodart		817-86642	8 wks	10 wks	25 yrs	YES	\$ 1,195.00						
8	Single-sided mobile radius shelving, 66"w x 48 "H, curved, all laminate	Brodart		817-86648	8 wks	10 wks	25 yrs	YES	\$ 1,298.00						
9	Double-sided book island (book browser ben), all laminate	Brodart	60112S00		8 wks	10 wks	25 yrs	YES	\$ 1,712.00						
10	Depressible book truck	Brodart	OTBPEDBCRPS		8 wks	10 wks	25 yrs	YES	\$ 725.00						
<b>CATALOG DISCOUNT</b>															
#	Manufacturer	Description	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	% Discount	Description	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	% Discount		
			std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					
1	Artopex	Casegoods and soft seating	5 wks	8 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	45%								
2	Bretford														
3	Brodart	media shelving, tables, chairs and lounge	8 wks	10 wks	25 yrs	No	44%								





				Vendor: Georgia Specialty Equipment, LLC						Krueger International, Inc.					
				Terms: Net 30						Net 30					
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
21	TenJam			kids seating	4 wks	5 wks	LTD Lifetime		40%						
22	Tesco														
23	VS														
<b>List any additional manufacturer's discount below</b>															
	Artco Bell														
	Academia														
	Atlona														
	Arold														
	Alumni														
	Burroughs														
	Carpet for Kids														
	ESI														
	Ghent														
	Haskell														
	Hon Smartlink														
	HON Build Tables														
	Hon Motivate tables														
	Hon Motivate Seating														
	Learniture														
	Magnusson Group			Specialty products, trash cans	4 wks	6 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	25%						
	MooreCo			white boards, seating and tables	4 wks	5 wks	LTD Lifetime	No	40%						
	National Office Furniture														
	Office Master														
	OFM														
	Paragaon														
	Palmiere Furniture														
	Roland														
	Virco														
	Fomcore			soft seating	4 wks	6 wks	LtD Lifetime	No	40%						



Vendor: Nisewonger Audio Visual Center, Inc.				Russell Ventures, Inc.											
Terms: Net 30				Net 30											
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
<b>Instructional Areas (commodity codes 42521, 42528, 47045)</b>															
1	Collaboration table, wavy half circle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949AMB-8600						No Bid	Academia HS-3052RY	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$210.52
2	Collaboration table, wavy rectangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949UND-8600						No Bid	Academia HS-3152CD	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$207.10
3	Collaboration table, wavy square, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949Plaque-8600						No Bid	Academia HS-5252ML	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$250.26
4	Collaboration table, wavy, triangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949Polygon-8600						No Bid	Academia HS-5252TN	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$250.35
5	Planner Studio Table 36"x72"x36"H, Butcher block top, casters	Smith System	25214BUTCHER						No Bid	Academia DHSFBFB-4260	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$884.35
6	Planner Maker Table, 30"x60"x22-32"H	Smith System	24552						No Bid	Smith System As Specified	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	5 yr	YES	\$624.60
7	Elemental 60" 6-Star Table. 21.5" - 35.5" H, casters	Smith System	EL6560 EA						No Bid	Academia WLA-6060AD	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$452.13
8	Table, Rectangle, 30x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3060-8600C						No Bid	Academia HL-3060	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$213.22
9	Table, Rectangle, 30x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3072-8600C						No Bid	Academia HL-3072	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$223.65
10	Table, Rectangle, 24x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C						No Bid	Academia HL-2460	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$199.47
11	Table, Rectangle, 24x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C						No Bid	Academia HL-2472	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$209.45
12	Table, 36" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD36-8600C						No Bid	Academia HL-36R	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$188.78
13	Table, 48" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD48-8600C						No Bid	Academia HL-48R	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$218.00
14	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU						No Bid	Academia Z28	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$51.87
15	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, casters	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU						No Bid	Academia Z28C	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$69.31
16	Café Stool, fixed height, 24", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5824JU						No Bid	Academia 7424Z	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$99.21
17	Café Stool, fixed height, 30", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5830JU						No Bid	Academia 7430Z	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$100.16
18	Active seating, Oodle stool, 17" diameter throughout, 3 interlocking pieces	SmithSystem	OODLE31						No Bid	Smith System As Specified	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	5 yr	YES	\$137.46
19	Instructor mobile podium, collaborative top, no basket, height adjustable	Smith System Sit-Stand Desk	26548V						No Bid	Haskell FZPN7-2130	4-6 wks	6-8 wks	12 yr	No (MAS)	\$385.66
20	Active seating, balancing stool, 18"	Mien	J4F-3530						No Bid	VS 03825-18	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	10 yr	YES	\$97.80
21	Active seating, balancing stool, 21"	Mien	J4F-3530						No Bid	VS 03825-21	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	10 yr	YES	\$100.68
22	Café table, 36" round, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01504/01453						No Bid	Academia CFSH-36R	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$278.15
23	Café table, 36" square, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01503/01453						No Bid	Academia CFSH-3636SQ	3-4 wks	4-6 wks	15 yr	No (MAS)	\$280.67









**Cobb County School District  
IFB B1910, Learning Commons Furniture**

Vendor: School Specialty, Inc.									
Terms: Net 30									
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
<b>Instructional Areas (commodity codes 42521, 42528, 47045)</b>									
1	Collaboration table, wavy half circle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949AMB-8600						No Bid
2	Collaboration table, wavy rectangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949UND-8600						No Bid
3	Collaboration table, wavy square, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949Plaque-8600						No Bid
4	Collaboration table, wavy, triangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949Polygon-8600						No Bid
5	Planner Studio Table 36"x72"x36"H, Butcher block top, casters	Smith System	25214BUTCHER						No Bid
6	Planner Maker Table, 30"x60"x22-32"H	Smith System	24552						No Bid
7	Elemental 60" 6-Star Table. 21.5" - 35.5" H, casters	Smith System	EL6560 EA						No Bid
8	Table, Rectangle, 30x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3060-8600C						No Bid
9	Table, Rectangle, 30x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3072-8600C						No Bid
10	Table, Rectangle, 24x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C						No Bid
11	Table, Rectangle, 24x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C						No Bid
12	Table, 36" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD36-8600C						No Bid
13	Table, 48" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD48-8600C						No Bid
14	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU						No Bid
15	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, casters	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU						No Bid
16	Café Stool, fixed height, 24", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5824JU						No Bid
17	Café Stool, fixed height, 30", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5830JU						No Bid
18	Active seating, Oodle stool, 17" diameter throughout, 3 interlocking pieces	SmithSystem	OODLE31						No Bid
19	Instructor mobile podium, collaborative top, no basket, height adjustable	Smith System Sit-Stand Desk	26548V						No Bid
20	Active seating, balancing stool, 18"	Mien	J4F-3530						No Bid
21	Active seating, balancing stool, 21"	Mien	J4F-3530						No Bid
22	Café table, 36" round, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01504/01453						No Bid
23	Café table, 36" square, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01503/01453						No Bid



**Cobb County School District  
IFB B1910, Learning Commons Furniture**

Vendor: <b>School Specialty, Inc.</b>									
Terms: <b>Net 30</b>									
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
24	Café table, 42" round, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01506/01457						No Bid
25	Café table, 42" square, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01505/01457						No Bid
26	Flat surface power module add on for Café tables, 2 USB, 1 AC port	SmithSystem	17098						No Bid
27	Power Tower with USB and AC charging access, 42" H, casters	Mooreco	27735						No Bid
28	Mobile whiteboard, 36" x 88", casters	Safeco	2016WBS						No Bid
29	Flex Charge Table Top Power Unit - FlexCharge4. 2 AC outlets; 2 quick-charge USB outlet. 8 foot cord	Flex Charge	FCH4-DSK-WHT						No Bid
30	Flex Charge Table Top Power Unit - FlexCharge9. 5 AC outlets; 4 quick-charge USB outlets. 8 foot cord	Flex Charge	FCH9-POD-WHT						No Bid
<b>Individual Area (commodity code 42084)</b>									
1	Node Desk - Tripod base with casters, swivel seat, movable worksurface	Steelcase Node Desk		Haskell -Ethos Chair ES1C1	4 - 6 wks	4 - 6 wks	12 yrs - See Warranty Statement	Yes	\$347.75
<b>Collaboration Station (commodity code 71560)</b>									
1	Multimedia Table, 4 student, (2 pwr, 4 USB) w/casters and display mount	SmithSystem	4161						No Bid
2	Multimedia Table, 6 student, (4 pwr, 8 USB) w/casters and display mount	SmithSystem	4138						No Bid
3	LED Commercial Display, 43", w/ 2 yr warranty, PC input		SmithSystem 04138						No Bid
4	4 Input HDMI switcher	AT-HD4-V41							No Bid
5	6 input HDMI switcher with toggle switch control								No Bid
6	HDMI cabling for each student and display		Atlona AT-HD4-V41						No Bid
7	VGA/audio to HDMI converters								No Bid
8	VGA/audio cabling								No Bid
9	Lightning to HDMI adapters								No Bid
<b>Shelving (No substitution of mfg) (commodity code 42052)</b>									
1	Double-sided mobile shelving, 36"w x 42"H , laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid
2	Double-sided mobile shelving, 36"w x 48"H , laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid
3	Double-sided mobile shelving, 36"w x 60"H , laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid
4	Double-sided mobile shelving, 72"w x 42"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid
5	Double-sided mobile shelving, 72"w x 48"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid
6	Double-sided mobile shelving, 72"w x 60"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid
7	Single-sided mobile radius shelving, 66"w x 42 "H, curved, all laminate	Brodart							No Bid
8	Single-sided mobile radius shelving, 66"w x 48 "H, curved, all laminate	Brodart							No Bid
9	Double-sided book island (book browser ben), all laminate	Brodart	60112S00						No Bid
10	Depressible book truck	Brodart	OTBPEDBCRPS						No Bid
<b>CATALOG DISCOUNT</b>									
#	Manufacturer	Description	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	% Discount		
			std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					
1	Artopex								
2	Bretford								
3	Brodart								





Vendor: School Specialty, Inc.									
Terms: Net 30									
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
	Allseating								
	Global								
	ESI								
	Berco								
	Mayline								
	Egan								
Notes: The awarded categories are highlighted.									

**Cobb County School District**  
**IFB B1910, Learning Commons Furniture**

		<b>Vendor:</b>		<b>School Outfitters</b>						<b>Virco, Inc.</b>					
		<b>Terms:</b>		<b>Net 30 days</b>						<b>Net 30</b>					
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
<b>Instructional Areas (commodity codes 42521, 42528, 47045)</b>															
1	Collaboration table, wavy half circle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949AMB-8600	LNT-RAL3100	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	MAS Green	\$269.00	VIRCO INC-50NEST54ADJ	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 246.73
2	Collaboration table, wavy rectangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949UND-8600	LNT-RAL3200	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	MAS Green	\$279.00	VIRCO INC - 50SL3054ADJC	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 322.20
3	Collaboration table, wavy square, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949Plaque-8600	LNT-RAL3300	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	MAS Green	\$357.00	VIRCO INC - 50SWV54ADJC	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 434.24
4	Collaboration table, wavy, triangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949Polygon-8600	LNT-RAL3400	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	MAS Green	\$299.00	VIRCO INC - 50HUB60ADJC	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 434.24
5	Planner Studio Table 36"x72"x36"H, Butcher block top, casters	Smith System	25214BUTCHER	DIV-AMT-7230	3-5 wks	4-6 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	MAS Green	\$930.00	VIRCO INC- 503672ADJCSU	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 369.58
6	Planner Maker Table, 30"x60"x22-32"H	Smith System	24552	LNT-INM3060-SO	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	Greenguard	\$386.00	VIRCO INC - VSC3072ADJUSU/VSCPS P	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 590.80
7	Elemental 60" 6-Star Table. 21.5" - 35.5" H, casters	Smith System	EL6S60 EA	LNT-48HAT	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	Greenguard	\$222.00	Virco Inc - 50FLOW60AEDJC	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 671.70
8	Table, Rectangle, 30x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3060-8600C	LNT-TFS3060-HPL-C	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	No	\$317.00	VIRCO INC- 503060ADJC	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 309.93
9	Table, Rectangle, 30x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3072-8600C	LNT-TFS3072-HPL-C	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	No	\$335.00	VIRCO INC- 503072ADJC	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 334.46
10	Table, Rectangle, 24x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C	LNT-TFS2460-HPL-C	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	No	\$307.00	VIRCO INC- 502460ADJC	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 364.17
11	Table, Rectangle, 24x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C	LNT-TFS2472-HPL-C	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	No	\$325.00	Virco Inc - 502472ADJC	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 328.33
12	Table, 36" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD36-8600C	LNT-TFS36R-HPL-C	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	No	\$306.00	Virco Inc - 5036RADJC	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 313.09
13	Table, 48" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD48-8600C	LNT-TFS48R-HPL-C	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	No	\$313.00	Virco Inc - 5048RADJC	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 413.76
14	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU	As Specified	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	MAS Green	\$81.00	Virco Inc - ZU418FG	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 88.00
15	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, casters	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU	As Specified	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	MAS Green	\$109.00	Virco Inc - ZUST18C	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 133.20
16	Café Stool, fixed height, 24", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5824JU	As Specified	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	MAS Green	\$227.00	Virco Inc - CZ25FG	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 117.99
17	Café Stool, fixed height, 30", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5830JU	As Specified	1-3 wks	2-5 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	MAS Green	\$234.00	Virco Inc - CZ30FG	2-8 wks	4-10 wks	SEE ATTACHED*	YES	\$ 144.27
18	Active seating, Oodle stool, 17" diameter throughout, 3 interlocking pieces	SmithSystem	OODLE31	LNT-NES3020-SO	1 week	1-2 wks	5 yr warranty	No	\$165.00						No Bid
19	Instructor mobile podium, collaborative top, no basket, height adjustable	Smith System Sit-Stand Desk	26548V	LNT-GNA3001-SO	1 week	1-2 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	No	\$218.00						No Bid
20	Active seating, balancing stool, 18"	Mien	J4F-3530	LNT-3046-18BK-SO	1 week	1-2 wks	5 yr warranty	Greenguard	\$89.00						No Bid
21	Active seating, balancing stool, 21"	Mien	J4F-3530	LNT-3046-20BK-SO	1 week	1-2 wks	5 yr warranty	Greenguard	\$92.00						No Bid
22	Café table, 36" round, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01504/01453	LNT-36RD-B1922-38	1-2 wks	1-3 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	No	\$297.00						No Bid
23	Café table, 36" square, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01503/01453	LNT-T36SQ-B2025SL-38	1-2 wks	1-3 wks	Ltd. Lifetime	No	\$254.00						No Bid









		Vendor:		School Outfitters						Virco, Inc.					
		Terms:		Net 30 days						Net 30					
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
	Allseating														
	Global														
	ESI														
	Berco														
	Mayline														
	Egan														
Notes: The awarded categories are highlighted.										* see bid for additional discounts based on volume, tailgate delivery, inside deliver, full service					

**Cobb County School District  
IFB B1910, Learning Commons Furniture**

				<b>Vendor:</b>	<b>Workspace Interiors by Office Depot</b>					
				<b>Terms:</b>	<b>Net 30</b>					
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31				
<b>Instructional Areas (commodity codes 42521, 42528, 47045)</b>										
1	Collaboration table, wavy half circle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949AMB-8600	HON HESN-3054-4L/HHABCASTER	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$307.46	
2	Collaboration table, wavy rectangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949UND-8600	HON HESW-3054E-4L/HHABCASTER	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$296.46	
3	Collaboration table, wavy square, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949PlaQue-8600	HON HETD-54E-4L/HHABCASTER	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$355.52	
4	Collaboration table, wavy, triangle, adj ht 25"-34", casters, any std. Wilsonart -60 or -38 laminate	Scholarcraft	FS949Polygon-8600	HON HESNP54E & HEB4LEG/HHABCASTER	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$313.56	
5	Planner Studio Table 36"x72"x36"H, Butcher block top, casters	Smith System	25214BUTCHER	HON HCTRECT3072 & HCT36MT	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$931.48	
6	Planner Maker Table, 30"x60"x22-32"H	Smith System	24552	HON HUTM3060	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$246.40	
7	Elemental 60" 6-Star Table. 21.5" - 35.5" H, casters	Smith System	EL6S60 EA	HON HESNP54E & HEB4LEG - Set of 3	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$852.72	
8	Table, Rectangle, 30x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3060-8600C	HON HETR-3060E-4L/HHABCASTER	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$283.42	
9	Table, Rectangle, 30x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE3072-8600C	HON HETR-3072E-4L/HHABCASTER	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$305.42	
10	Table, Rectangle, 24x60, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C	HON HETR-2460E-4L/HHABCASTER	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$278.54	
11	Table, Rectangle, 24x72, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RE2460-8600C	HON HETR-2472E-4L/HHABCASTER	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$294.83	
12	Table, 36" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD36-8600C	HON HERD-42E-4L/HHABCASTER	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$243.72	
13	Table, 48" Round, casters	Scholarcraft	FS949RD48-8600C	HON HERD-48E-4L/HHABCASTER	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$258.80	
14	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU	HON HSS4L-18B CARTON OF 4	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$238.58	
15	Student Chair, 18" stack chair, casters	Scholarcraft	SC5118JU	HON HSS4L-18B W CASTERS 4 PER CARTON	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$320.90	
16	Café Stool, fixed height, 24", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5824JU	HON HMG5	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$168.15	
17	Café Stool, fixed height, 30", jumbo shell, smooth back, glides	Scholarcraft	SC5830JU	HON HMG5	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$168.15	
18	Active seating, Oodle stool, 17" diameter throughout, 3 interlocking pieces	SmithSystem	OODLE31	MOORECO #50960-XXXX	2-3 wks	4-5 wks	1 yr	No	\$125.55	
19	Instructor mobile podium, collaborative top, no basket, height adjustable	Smith System Sit-Stand Desk	26548V	HMVPCA1-1830G	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$561.03	
20	Active seating, balancing stool, 18"	Mien	J4F-3530	MOORECO 50960	2-3 wks	4-5 wks	1 yr	No	\$125.55	
21	Active seating, balancing stool, 21"	Mien	J4F-3530	MOORECO 50970	2-3 wks	4-5 wks	1 yr	No	\$125.55	
22	Café table, 36" round, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01504/01453	HON HCTRND36/HCT42MX	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$458.30	
23	Café table, 36" square, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01503/01453	HON HCTSQR36/HCT42MX	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$451.08	

**Cobb County School District  
IFB B1910, Learning Commons Furniture**

				<b>Vendor:</b>	<b>Workspace Interiors by Office Depot</b>					
				<b>Terms:</b>	<b>Net 30</b>					
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price	
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31				
24	Café table, 42" round, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01506/01457	HON HCTRND42/HCT42MX	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$487.22	
25	Café table, 42" square, pedestal base	SmithSystem	01505/01457	HON HCTSQR42/HCT42MX	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$479.09	
26	Flat surface power module add on for Café tables, 2 USB, 1 AC port	SmithSystem	17098	HON HGRMTUSB2	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$106.23	
27	Power Tower with USB and AC charging access, 42" H, casters	Mooreco	27735		3-4 wks	4-5 wks	1 yr	No	\$351.57	
28	Mobile whiteboard, 36" x 88", casters	Safeco	2016WBS		3-4 wks	4-5 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$392.94	
29	Flex Charge Table Top Power Unit - FlexCharge4. 2 AC outlets; 2 quick-charge USB outlet. 8 foot cord	Flex Charge	FCH4-DSK-WHT		2 wks	3 wks	1 yr	No	\$135.87	
30	Flex Charge Table Top Power Unit - FlexCharge9. 5 AC outlets; 4 quick-charge USB outlets. 8 foot cord	Flex Charge	FCH9-POD-WHT		2 wks	3 wks	1 yr	No	\$139.05	
<b>Individual Area (commodity code 42084)</b>										
1	Node Desk - Tripod base with casters, swivel seat, movable worksurface	Steelcase Node Desk		HASKELL - ES1C1	5 wks	6-7 wks	Full Lifetime	Yes	\$402.84	
<b>Collaboration Station (commodity code 71560)</b>										
1	Multimedia Table, 4 student, (2 pwr, 4 USB) w/casters and display mount	SmithSystem	4161	MOORECO #27749	2-3 wks	4-5 wks	12 yr	Yes	\$736.95	
2	Multimedia Table, 6 student, (4 pwr, 8 USB) w/casters and display mount	SmithSystem	4138	MOORECO #27755	2-3 wks	4-5 wks	12 yr	Yes	\$1,096.20	
3	LED Commercial Display, 43", w/ 2 yr warranty, PC input		SmithSystem 04138	SAMSUNG HG43NE477SFXZA	2-3 wks	4 wks	2 yr	NO	\$425.46	
4	4 Input HDMI switcher	AT-HD4-V41		STARTECH VS421HD20	2-3 wks	4 wks	2 yr	NO	\$49.94	
5	6 input HDMI switcher with toggle switch control			C2G 41501	2-3 wks	4 wks	1 yr	NO	\$77.41	
6	HDMI cabling for each student and display		Atlona AT-HD4-V41	BELKINS F8V3311B04	2-3 wks	4 wks	90 Day	NO	\$7.87	
7	VGA/audio to HDMI converters			C2G 41410	2-3 wks	4 wks	1 yr	NO	\$72.78	
8	VGA/audio cabling			BLACK BOX EVNPS06B-0010-MM	2-3 Week	4 wks	2 yr	NO	\$17.33	
9	Lightning to HDMI adapters			APPLE MD826AM/A	2-3 wks	4 wks	1 yr	NO	\$45.28	
<b>Shelving (No substitution of mfg) (commodity code 42052)</b>										
1	Double-sided mobile shelving, 36"w x 42"H , laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid	
2	Double-sided mobile shelving, 36"w x 48"H , laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid	
3	Double-sided mobile shelving, 36"w x 60"H , laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid	
4	Double-sided mobile shelving, 72"w x 42"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid	
5	Double-sided mobile shelving, 72"w x 48"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid	
6	Double-sided mobile shelving, 72"w x 60"H, laminate frame, metal shelving	Brodart							No Bid	
7	Single-sided mobile radius shelving, 66"w x 42 "H, curved, all laminate	Brodart							No Bid	
8	Single-sided mobile radius shelving, 66"w x 48 "H, curved, all laminate	Brodart							No Bid	
9	Double-sided book island (book browser ben), all laminate	Brodart	60112500						No Bid	
10	Depressible book truck	Brodart	OTBPEDBCRPS						No Bid	
<b>CATALOG DISCOUNT</b>										
#	Manufacturer	Description	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	% Discount			
			std.	July 1 - Aug. 31						
1	Artopex		4-7 wks	5-8wks	By cat.	Yes	50%			
2	Bretford		3-4 wks	5-7 wks	std. 12 yrs	By cat.	41.77%			
3	Brodart									





Cobb County School District  
IFB B1910, Learning Commons Furniture

Vendor:				Workspace Interiors by Office Depot					
Terms:				Net 30					
#	Description	MFG	Model #	Proposed Equivalent	Lead Time		WTY	Green Guard Certified?	Unit Price
					std.	July 1 - Aug. 31			
	Allseating								
	Global				5 wks	6-7 wks	By cat.	Yes	54.74%
	ESI								
	Berco								
	Mayline								
	Egan								
Notes: <b>The awarded categories are highlighted.</b>				*Catalog discounts are based on std. day to day orders. Discounting may be deeper for project purchases. ** Installation for catalog discount orders will be calculated when quoted based on product selected. *** Office Depot has strived to provide the most aggressive pricing structure assuming no quantities or order sizes despite varying manufacturer freight policies among other factors. In order to achieve this, Office Depot reserves the right to assess a small order fee not to exceed \$300 on all orders with a list price total less than \$3,000. This will be clearly indicated as a separate line on the quote provided.					