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# CCSD # Description
Est. 
Qty.

UOM
Manufacturer/

Model#
Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Manufacturer/
Model#

Unit Price
Extended 

Price

1
Paint, Interior, Acrylic Latex, Flat.  Sherwin Williams Super Paint Flat A86W00151 or CCSD 
approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

150 GAL No Bid PPG Hi-Hide 689-10 $17.95 $2,692.50

2
Paint, Interior, Acrylic Latex, Semi-Gloss.  Sherwin Williams Super Paint Semi-Gloss 
A88W01153 or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

50 GAL No Bid PPG Hi-Hide 109-10 $20.95 $1,047.50

3 Paint, Exterior, Acrylic Latex, Flat  NON-AWARD 50 GAL No Bid PPG Speedhide 6-610XI $11.74 $587.00
4 Paint, Exterior, Acrylic Latex, Semi-Gloss  NON-AWARD 50 GAL No Bid PPG Speedhide 6-900XI $14.95 $747.50
5 Paint, Interior, Oil Base, Semi-Gloss  NON-AWARD 500 GAL No Bid PPG Glyptex 439-10 $13.99 $6,995.00

6 Paint, Exterior, Oil Base, Gloss  NON-AWARD 25 GAL No Bid PPG Glyptex 4139-10 $15.73 $393.25

7
Paint, Exterior, Oil Base, Gloss, Industrial Enamel, White or Mid Tone Colors  NON-
AWARD

75 GAL No Bid PPG HPC 4308-0100 $15.73 $1,179.75

8 Paint, Exterior, Oil Base, Gloss, Industrial Enamel, Deep or Accent Colors  NON-AWARD 125 GAL No Bid PPG HPC 4308-0300 $15.73 $1,966.25

9 Paint, Exterior, Oil Base, Gloss; OSHA Safety Colors  NON-AWARD 25 GAL No Bid PPG HPC 4308-9000 $21.65 $541.25

10
Concrete and Masonry Primer/Sealer, White.  Sherwin Williams LX02W0050 or CCSD 
approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL No Bid PPG Perma-Crete 4-603XI $15.56 $389.00

11
Pro-Cryl Universal Primer, Self-Linking with Rust Inhibitive, Off White.  Sherwin Williams 
B66W01310  NON-AWARD

25 GAL No Bid PPG Pitt-Tech Plus 4020-1000 $19.53 $488.25

12
Pro-Cryl Universal Primer, Self-Linking with Rust Inhibitive, Medium Grey.  Sherwin 
Williams B66A01320  NON-AWARD

25 GAL No Bid PPG Pitt-Tech Plus 90-909 $19.53 $488.25

13
Pro-Cryl Universal Primer, Self-Linking with Rust Inhibitive, Red Oxide.  Sherwin Williams 
B66N01310  NON-AWARD

25 GAL No Bid PPG Pit-Tech Plus 4020-7100 $21.50 $537.50

14
Pre-Catalyzed Water Based Epoxy, Single Component, Eg-Shel.  Sherwin Williams K45-
140 Series or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL No Bid PPG Pit-Glaze 16-310 $15.48 $387.00

15
Pre-Catalyzed Water Based Epoxy, Single Component, Semi-Gloss.  Sherwin Williams K46-
140 Series or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL No Bid PPG Pitt-Glaze 16-510 $15.48 $387.00

16
DTN Acrylic Coating, Interior/Exterior Water Based Corrosion Resistant Coating, Extra 
White.  Sherwin Williams B66W01251 or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL No Bid PPG Pitt-Tech Plus 90-1110 $19.53 $488.25

17
DTN Acrylic Coating, Interior/Exterior Water Based Corrosion Resistant Coating, Deep 
Blue.  Sherwin Williams B66W01253 or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL No Bid PPG Pitt-Tech Plus 90-1130 $19.53 $488.25

19
Universal Metal Primer, A Rust Inhibiting, Modified Phenolic Alkyd Resin Primer, Off 
White.  Sherwin Williams B50WZ0001 or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL No Bid PPG MultiPrime 4160-7100 $19.53 $488.25

20
Universal Metal Primer, A Rust Inhibiting, Modified Phenolic Alkyd Resin Primer, Gray.  
Sherwin Williams B50AZ0006 or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL No Bid PPG MultiPrime 4160-6120 $19.53 $488.25

21
Waterbased Urethane Floor Enamel, Low VOC, Impact and Chemical Resistant.  Sherwin 
Williams Armorseal 1K B65A775 or CCSD approved equivalent.  NON-AWARD

30 GAL No Bid PPG Floor & Porch 3-510XI $12.29 $368.70

22
Waterbased Epoxy Floor Coating, Low VOC, Resistant to Moisture Vapor Transmission, 
Impact and Chemical Resistant.  Sherwin Williams Armorseal 8100 or CCSD approved 
equivalent.  NON-AWARD

30 GAL No Bid PPG Aquapon WB EB Epoxy 98E-1 $74.39 $2,231.70

Cobb Hardware
Net 30

PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc
Net 30

Vendor:
Terms:

Group 1 - Vendor MUST supply specification sheet for each item
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Cobb Hardware
Net 30

PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc
Net 30

Vendor:
Terms:

# CCSD # Description
Est. 
Qty.

UOM
Manufacturer/

Model#
Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Manufacturer/
Model#

Unit Price
Extended 

Price

1
Roller Frame, 9" Professional, Wood Handle.  Duron 8650098 or CCSD approved 
equivalent

100 EA No Bid Arrowworthy RF209W (ARR20900/EA) $5.50 $550.00

2
Roller Cover, Nylon, 9"x1-1/4" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

80 EA No Bid
Wooster Suber Fab RR926-9 

(WBC17725/EA)
$3.25 $260.00

3
Roller Cover, Polyester, 6-1/2"x1/2" NAP, "Long Reach Cover, Cigar Cover", Elite Pink.  
Sherwin Williams, Container Series Mini Roller or CCSD approved equivalent

120 EA No Bid
Wooster Mini-Koter R229 

(WBC18962/EA)
$2.95 $354.00

4
Roller Cover, Polyester, 9"x3/4" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

120 EA No Bid
Wooster Pro Doo-Z RR668-9 

(WBC17695/EA)
$2.75 $330.00

5
Roller Cover, Polyester, 9"x1/2" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

120 EA No Bid
Wooster Pro Doo-Z RR667-9 

(WBC17694/EA)
$2.65 $318.00

6
Roller Cover, Polyester, 9"x3/8" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

60 EA No Bid
Wooster Pro Doo-Z RR669-9 

(WBC17693/EA)
$2.40 $144.00

7
Roller Cover, Polyester, 4"x1/2" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

60 EA No Bid
Wooster Pro Doo-Z RR666-4 

(WBC17982/EA)
$1.33 $79.80

8
Roller Cover, Polyester, 4"x3/4" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

60 EA No Bid
Wooster Super Doo-Z R203-4 

(WBC12091/EA)
$1.92 $115.20

9
Roller Cover, Mini Woven Fibers, 6-1/2"x1/4", Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD 
approved equivalent

60 EA No Bid
Wooster Pro Doo-Z RR373-6 

(WBC17741/EA)
$2.93 $175.80

10 Coveralls, Disposable, Assorted Sizes M/L/XL 50 EA No Bid Trimaco Supertuff 09901 (TRC09901/EA) $3.75 $187.50

11 Spray Sock 50 EA No Bid Trimaco 09301A (TFI09301/EA) $0.90 $45.00

12 Mask, Paper. 3M 8500 or CCSD approved equivalent 200 EA No Bid
3M 8500 Disco - 3M 8511 (5 units per 

pack - $8.00) - (MMM91757/EA) - Price is 
per unit

$1.60 $320.00

13 Respirator Replacement Cartridge. 3M6001 ONLY 80 EA No Bid
3M 6001 (3 units per pack - $25.95) - 
(MMM32440/EA) - Price is per unit

$8.65 $692.00

1 NEW Paint, Traffic Marking, Latex, Yellow, 5 Gallon 20 CAN No Bid
Aexcel 72Y-A113 (AEX00365/EA) - Price is 

per 5 gallon
$59.95 $1,199.00

2 NEW Paint, Traffic Marking, Latex, White, 5 Gallon 25 CAN No Bid
Aexcel 72W-A136 (AEX00366/EA) - Price 

is per 5 gallon
$59.95 $1,498.75

3 NEW Paint, Traffic Marking, Latex, Handicap Blue, Medium Grade, 5 Gallon 60 CAN No Bid
Aexcel 72L-A032 (AEX00702/EA) - Price is 

per 5 gallon
$53.60 $3,216.00

4 NEW Paint, Traffic Marking, Latex, Bright or Fire Engine Red, Medium Grade, 5 Gallon 80 CAN No Bid
Aexcel 72R-A028 (AEX00703/EA) - Price is 

per 5 gallon
$88.85 $7,108.00

5 Primer, Interior/Exterior, Oil Base, 1 Gallon.  "Kilz" or CCSD approved equivalent 30 GAL No Bid PPG Sealgrip 17-941NF $11.18 $335.40
6 MP023A Paint, Floor & Deck, Urethane, Medium Gray, 1 Gallon 20 GAL No Bid PPG Floor & Porch 3-510XI $12.29 $245.80
7 Paint, Aerosol, Oil Base, 12oz Can, High Gloss Colors (see specs) 500 CAN No Bid PPG Pitt Bull 55-Series $2.45 $1,225.00
8 MP032 Primer, Spray, Gray, 12oz Can 30 CAN No Bid PPG Pitt Bull 55-615 $3.50 $105.00

9 BH084 Caulk, Interior/Exterior, Silicone, Clear.  GE5000 ONLY 600 TUBE
Momentive Performance Material 

GE5000
$5.85 $3,510.00

GE5000 - (LHP05000/EA) - (PPG Equiv 
Top Gun 1418C $3.85 per tube, $1.90 

savings per tube, if interested)
$5.75 $3,450.00

10 MP055 Caulk, Interior/Exterior, Latex, White.  DAP Titanium or CCSD approved equivalent 300 TUBE No Bid PPG Top Gun 1414X $1.10 $330.00

Group 2

Group 3
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Cobb Hardware
Net 30

PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc
Net 30

Vendor:
Terms:

# CCSD # Description
Est. 
Qty.

UOM
Manufacturer/

Model#
Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Manufacturer/
Model#

Unit Price
Extended 

Price

11 MP052 Spackling Paste, Interior, White, Ready Mixed, 1 Gallon 10 GAL No Bid Westpac 55181 (WSP55180/EA) $11.50 $115.00
12 MP002 Sanding Sealer, 1 Gallon 10 GAL No Bid PPG Deft DFT61 $13.99 $139.90
13 MP048 Stain, Various Colors, 1 Gallon.  Minwax or CCSD approved equivalent 10 GAL No Bid PPG Deft DFT400 $19.50 $195.00

14 MP021
Water Proofing Formula for Concrete & Wood, 1 Gallon.  Thompsons Water Sealer or 
CCSD approved equivalent

20 GAL No Bid Olympic 55548 $10.95 $219.00

15 MP043
Roller Frame, 9" Professional, Plastic Handle.  Wooster Magikage Ninety or CCSD 
approved equivalent

50 EA No Bid Wooster R016-9 (WBC66279/EA) $3.00 $150.00

16 MP038
Roller Cover, Nylon, 9"x1/2" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

300 EA No Bid
Wooster Pro Doo-Z RR667-9 

(WBC17694/EA)
$2.62 $786.00

17 MP035 Paint Brush, 3" Nylon, Good Quality.  Porter Nylock, Sprig or CCSD approved equivalent 100 EA No Bid
Wooster Ultra Pro/Soft 4169-3 

(WBC18406/EA)
$6.99 $699.00

18 MP033
Paint Brush, 3", Economy.  Latex & Oil Base Porter Provantage Nylon/Polyester or CCSD 
approved equivalent

150 EA No Bid
Wooster Silver Tip 5222-3 

(WBC15541/EA)
$2.11 $316.50

19 MP041
Paint Pan, Plastic.  Agree Plastic Molded Paint Tray or CCSD approved equivalent (NOT 
TRAY LINERS)

50 EA No Bid Wooster BR549-11 (WBC16801/EA) $2.00 $100.00

20 MP040 Paint Grid, Metal, 5 Gallon 30 EA No Bid Wooster F001 (WBC14827) $1.15 $34.50
21 MP044 Painters Tape, Blue, 1"x60 yds 36 RL No Bid 3M 2090 Blue 1" (MMM03681/EA) $2.85 $102.60

22 MP046 Painters Tape, Blue, 1-1/2"x60 yds 36 RL No Bid 3M 2090 Blue 1-1/2" (MMM03682/EA) $4.05 $145.80

23 MP047 Painters Tape, Blue, 2"x60 yds 36 RL No Bid 3M 2090 Blue 2" (MMM03683/EA) $5.25 $189.00

24 Sandpaper, Pro Grade 80 Grit, package of 20.  3M Brand or CCSD approved equivalent. 50 PKG No Bid 3M 207080 Tri-20 (MMM34271/PK) $10.93 $546.50

25 Sandpaper, Pro Grade 100 Grit, package of 20.  3M Brand or CCSD approved equivalent. 50 PKG No Bid 3M 27100 Tri-20 (MMM34273/PK) $10.93 $546.50

26 Sandpaper, Pro Grade 120 Grit, package of 20.  3M Brand or CCSD approved equivalent. 50 PKG No Bid 3M 27120 Tri-20 (MMM34274/PK) $10.93 $546.50

27
Painter’s Coveralls, Heavy Duty with Hood, Microporous Bi-Laminate Polyolefin.  “Tri 
Maco” Brand or CCSD approved equivalent.

30 EA No Bid
Trimaco Body Barrier 09961 

(TRC09961/EA)
$6.25 $187.50

28 Line Sprayer Tip.  Graco RACS Switch Tip LL5 417 ONLY. 30 EA No Bid Graco RAC5 LL5 417 (GRA91882/EA) $26.43 $792.90
29 Line Sprayer Tip.  Graco RACS Switch Tip LL5 315 ONLY. 30 EA No Bid Graco RAC5 LL5 315 (GRA91875/EA) $26.43 $792.90
#

1
Item does not meet specs.
Awarded items highlighted in yellow.

Discount

Retail paints 60% off/Sundries retail 30% off

Group 3 cont.

Discount
Discount for related items not listed.

DiscountDescription
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# CCSD # Description
Est. 
Qty.

UOM

1
Paint, Interior, Acrylic Latex, Flat.  Sherwin Williams Super Paint Flat A86W00151 or CCSD 
approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

150 GAL

2
Paint, Interior, Acrylic Latex, Semi-Gloss.  Sherwin Williams Super Paint Semi-Gloss 
A88W01153 or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

50 GAL

3 Paint, Exterior, Acrylic Latex, Flat  NON-AWARD 50 GAL
4 Paint, Exterior, Acrylic Latex, Semi-Gloss  NON-AWARD 50 GAL
5 Paint, Interior, Oil Base, Semi-Gloss  NON-AWARD 500 GAL

6 Paint, Exterior, Oil Base, Gloss  NON-AWARD 25 GAL

7
Paint, Exterior, Oil Base, Gloss, Industrial Enamel, White or Mid Tone Colors  NON-
AWARD

75 GAL

8 Paint, Exterior, Oil Base, Gloss, Industrial Enamel, Deep or Accent Colors  NON-AWARD 125 GAL

9 Paint, Exterior, Oil Base, Gloss; OSHA Safety Colors  NON-AWARD 25 GAL

10
Concrete and Masonry Primer/Sealer, White.  Sherwin Williams LX02W0050 or CCSD 
approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL

11
Pro-Cryl Universal Primer, Self-Linking with Rust Inhibitive, Off White.  Sherwin Williams 
B66W01310  NON-AWARD

25 GAL

12
Pro-Cryl Universal Primer, Self-Linking with Rust Inhibitive, Medium Grey.  Sherwin 
Williams B66A01320  NON-AWARD

25 GAL

13
Pro-Cryl Universal Primer, Self-Linking with Rust Inhibitive, Red Oxide.  Sherwin Williams 
B66N01310  NON-AWARD

25 GAL

14
Pre-Catalyzed Water Based Epoxy, Single Component, Eg-Shel.  Sherwin Williams K45-
140 Series or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL

15
Pre-Catalyzed Water Based Epoxy, Single Component, Semi-Gloss.  Sherwin Williams K46-
140 Series or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL

16
DTN Acrylic Coating, Interior/Exterior Water Based Corrosion Resistant Coating, Extra 
White.  Sherwin Williams B66W01251 or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL

17
DTN Acrylic Coating, Interior/Exterior Water Based Corrosion Resistant Coating, Deep 
Blue.  Sherwin Williams B66W01253 or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL

19
Universal Metal Primer, A Rust Inhibiting, Modified Phenolic Alkyd Resin Primer, Off 
White.  Sherwin Williams B50WZ0001 or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL

20
Universal Metal Primer, A Rust Inhibiting, Modified Phenolic Alkyd Resin Primer, Gray.  
Sherwin Williams B50AZ0006 or CCSD approved equivalent  NON-AWARD

25 GAL

21
Waterbased Urethane Floor Enamel, Low VOC, Impact and Chemical Resistant.  Sherwin 
Williams Armorseal 1K B65A775 or CCSD approved equivalent.  NON-AWARD

30 GAL

22
Waterbased Epoxy Floor Coating, Low VOC, Resistant to Moisture Vapor Transmission, 
Impact and Chemical Resistant.  Sherwin Williams Armorseal 8100 or CCSD approved 
equivalent.  NON-AWARD

30 GAL

Vendor:
Terms:

Group 1 - Vendor MUST supply specification sheet for each item

Manufacturer/
Model#

Unit Price
Extended 

Price

Super Paint Flat A86W00151 $10.90 $1,635.00

Super Paint Semi Gloss A88W00153 $11.06 $553.00

A-100 Ext Flat A6W151 $13.16 $658.00
A-100 Ext Semi Gloss A8W151 $13.36 $668.00
Promar 200 Alkyd Semi Gloss $16.89 $8,445.00

Pro Industrial Urethane Alkyd Gloss 
B54W151

$19.56 $489.00

Pro Industrial Urethane Alkyd Gloss 
B54W151

$19.56 $1,467.00

Pro Industrial Urethane Alkyd Gloss 
B54T154

$19.56 $2,445.00

Pro Industrial Urethane Alkyd Safety $28.13 $703.25

Loxon Primer LX02W0050 $17.53 $438.25

Pro Cryl Primer B66W1310 $21.90 $547.50

Pro Cryl Primer B66A01320 $21.90 $547.50

Pro Cryl Primer B66N01310 $21.90 $547.50

Pre Cat WB Epoxy K45W1151 $17.61 $440.25

Pre Cat WB Epoxy K46W1151 $15.89 $397.25

DTM Acrylic Coating B66W01251 $12.55 $313.75

DTM Acrylic Coating B66W01253 $12.55 $313.75

Kem Kromik Primer B50WZ0001 $27.18 $679.50

Kem Kromik Primer B50AZ006 $27.18 $679.50

Armoseal 1K B65A775 $47.13 $1,413.90

Armoseal 8100 B70A08100 $57.13 $1,713.90

The Sherwin Williams Paint Company
Net 30
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Vendor:
Terms:

# CCSD # Description
Est. 
Qty.

UOM

1
Roller Frame, 9" Professional, Wood Handle.  Duron 8650098 or CCSD approved 
equivalent

100 EA

2
Roller Cover, Nylon, 9"x1-1/4" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

80 EA

3
Roller Cover, Polyester, 6-1/2"x1/2" NAP, "Long Reach Cover, Cigar Cover", Elite Pink.  
Sherwin Williams, Container Series Mini Roller or CCSD approved equivalent

120 EA

4
Roller Cover, Polyester, 9"x3/4" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

120 EA

5
Roller Cover, Polyester, 9"x1/2" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

120 EA

6
Roller Cover, Polyester, 9"x3/8" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

60 EA

7
Roller Cover, Polyester, 4"x1/2" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

60 EA

8
Roller Cover, Polyester, 4"x3/4" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

60 EA

9
Roller Cover, Mini Woven Fibers, 6-1/2"x1/4", Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD 
approved equivalent

60 EA

10 Coveralls, Disposable, Assorted Sizes M/L/XL 50 EA

11 Spray Sock 50 EA

12 Mask, Paper. 3M 8500 or CCSD approved equivalent 200 EA

13 Respirator Replacement Cartridge. 3M6001 ONLY 80 EA

1 NEW Paint, Traffic Marking, Latex, Yellow, 5 Gallon 20 CAN

2 NEW Paint, Traffic Marking, Latex, White, 5 Gallon 25 CAN

3 NEW Paint, Traffic Marking, Latex, Handicap Blue, Medium Grade, 5 Gallon 60 CAN

4 NEW Paint, Traffic Marking, Latex, Bright or Fire Engine Red, Medium Grade, 5 Gallon 80 CAN

5 Primer, Interior/Exterior, Oil Base, 1 Gallon.  "Kilz" or CCSD approved equivalent 30 GAL
6 MP023A Paint, Floor & Deck, Urethane, Medium Gray, 1 Gallon 20 GAL
7 Paint, Aerosol, Oil Base, 12oz Can, High Gloss Colors (see specs) 500 CAN
8 MP032 Primer, Spray, Gray, 12oz Can 30 CAN

9 BH084 Caulk, Interior/Exterior, Silicone, Clear.  GE5000 ONLY 600 TUBE

10 MP055 Caulk, Interior/Exterior, Latex, White.  DAP Titanium or CCSD approved equivalent 300 TUBE

Group 2

Group 3

The Sherwin Williams Paint Company
Net 30

Manufacturer/
Model#

Unit Price
Extended 

Price

Wood Pro 9"/6508-52080 $9.65 $965.00

CS Poly Knit 9"x1.25"/6509-70973 $5.10 $408.00

Pink Mini Roller 6.5"x.5" 2 pack/6501-
82728

$3.35 $402.00

CS Poly Knit 9"x.75"/6509-70916 $4.33 $519.60

CS Poly Knit 9"x.5"/6509-70890 $3.91 $469.20

CS Poly Knit 9"x3/8"/6509-70882 $3.77 $226.20

4"x1/2" Jumbo Marathon 2 pack/6506-
87114

$6.15 $369.00

4"x3/4" Jumbo Marathon 2 pack/6506-
87122

$6.29 $377.40

6.5"x.25" Pink Mini Covers 2 pack/6502-
10537

$6.78 $406.80

Coveralls All Purpose/1000-63197 $6.92 $346.00

Spray Hood/416-8944 $1.74 $87.00

8511 3M Respirator 10 pack/165-0746 $16.79 $3,358.00

3M Organic Vapor Cartridge 2 pk/573-
4298

$22.32 $1,785.60

SetFast Yellow/8000-52904
Priced per gallon; 5-gallon=$55

$11.00 $1,100.00

SetFast White/8000-02786
Priced per gallon; 5-gallon=$55

$11.00 $1,375.00

SetFast Blue/6401-14641
Priced per gallon; 5-gallon=$55

$11.00 $3,300.00

SetFast Red/6401-14666
Priced per gallon; 5-gallon=$61.80

$12.36 $4,944.00

ProBlock Oil Primer/B79W08810 $13.51 $405.30
Armor Seal Rexthane/B65A00060 $82.33 $1,646.60

5505 Gloss Black/1017-15852 $2.52 $1,260.00
5582 Gray Prime/1017-16066 $2.52 $75.60

No Bid

White Lighting Silicone/934-7717 $6.22 $1,866.00
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Vendor:
Terms:

# CCSD # Description
Est. 
Qty.

UOM

11 MP052 Spackling Paste, Interior, White, Ready Mixed, 1 Gallon 10 GAL
12 MP002 Sanding Sealer, 1 Gallon 10 GAL
13 MP048 Stain, Various Colors, 1 Gallon.  Minwax or CCSD approved equivalent 10 GAL

14 MP021
Water Proofing Formula for Concrete & Wood, 1 Gallon.  Thompsons Water Sealer or 
CCSD approved equivalent

20 GAL

15 MP043
Roller Frame, 9" Professional, Plastic Handle.  Wooster Magikage Ninety or CCSD 
approved equivalent

50 EA

16 MP038
Roller Cover, Nylon, 9"x1/2" NAP, Pro Doo-Z.  Wooster Brand or CCSD approved 
equivalent

300 EA

17 MP035 Paint Brush, 3" Nylon, Good Quality.  Porter Nylock, Sprig or CCSD approved equivalent 100 EA

18 MP033
Paint Brush, 3", Economy.  Latex & Oil Base Porter Provantage Nylon/Polyester or CCSD 
approved equivalent

150 EA

19 MP041
Paint Pan, Plastic.  Agree Plastic Molded Paint Tray or CCSD approved equivalent (NOT 
TRAY LINERS)

50 EA

20 MP040 Paint Grid, Metal, 5 Gallon 30 EA
21 MP044 Painters Tape, Blue, 1"x60 yds 36 RL

22 MP046 Painters Tape, Blue, 1-1/2"x60 yds 36 RL

23 MP047 Painters Tape, Blue, 2"x60 yds 36 RL

24 Sandpaper, Pro Grade 80 Grit, package of 20.  3M Brand or CCSD approved equivalent. 50 PKG

25 Sandpaper, Pro Grade 100 Grit, package of 20.  3M Brand or CCSD approved equivalent. 50 PKG

26 Sandpaper, Pro Grade 120 Grit, package of 20.  3M Brand or CCSD approved equivalent. 50 PKG

27
Painter’s Coveralls, Heavy Duty with Hood, Microporous Bi-Laminate Polyolefin.  “Tri 
Maco” Brand or CCSD approved equivalent.

30 EA

28 Line Sprayer Tip.  Graco RACS Switch Tip LL5 417 ONLY. 30 EA
29 Line Sprayer Tip.  Graco RACS Switch Tip LL5 315 ONLY. 30 EA
#

1
Item does not meet specs.
Awarded items highlighted in yellow.

Group 3 cont.

Discount
Discount for related items not listed.

Description

The Sherwin Williams Paint Company
Net 30

Manufacturer/
Model#

Unit Price
Extended 

Price

Pro Select Spackling/151-2649 $21.55 $215.50
Minwax Sand & Sealer/6510-61129 $36.75 $367.50

Minwax Stains/154-3321 $25.20 $252.00

No Bid

Heavy Duty 9" Frame/6510-37186 $5.94 $297.00

CS Poly Knit 9"x.5"/6509-70890 $3.91 $1,173.00

3" Nylox Sprig/422-0471 $7.52 $752.00

3" Premium XL/180-7478 $2.28 $342.00

Green Plastic Tray/6503-83532 $1.82 $91.00

Bucket Grid/180-1281 $1.49 $44.70
2090 Blue Tape 1"/821-8026 $3.02 $108.72

2090 Blue Tape 1.5"/965-8337 $4.34 $156.24

2090 Blue Tape 2"/821-8034 $4.97 $178.92

No Slip Grip 80/906-0658 $11.19 $559.50

No Slip Grip 100/906-0666 $11.19 $559.50

No Slip Grip 120/906-0674 $11.19 $559.50

Heavy Duty Coveralls/1000-63239 $8.53 $255.90

Line Stripping Tip 417/220-6191 $44.50 $1,335.00
Line Stripping Tip 315/220-6126 $44.50 $1,335.00

Discount

Non paint items list price -30%, Paint products list price -20%
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