
Tabsheet COBB COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
RFQ 2022005, SURGICAL INSTRUMENTS AND ACCESSORIES FOR CITA
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PRICE

1 6 3/4" Bonney Tissue Forceps - TC 1x2 Teeth 5 EA SKLAR 51-2170 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC SU2542 N/A $24.79 $123.93
2 Adson-Brown Thumb Forceps, 1x2 Teeth - 4 3/4" 5 EA VON-KLAUS VK106-2112 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
3 Allis Tissue Forcepss 4x5 Teeth  6" 5 EA SKLAR 36-2160 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 36-2160 N/A $86.91 $434.57
4 Babcock Tissue Forceps 6 1/4" 5 EA BABCOCK G11-19 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC MH16-44 N/A $80.46 $402.29
5 Babcock Tissue Forceps 8" 5 EA BABCOCK G11-60 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 16-46 N/A $176.83 $884.14
6 Backhaus Gathering Towel Clamp 5.5" 5 EA SKLAR 47-2955 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 47-2955 N/A $51.66 $258.29
7 Beaver Knife Handle 1 EA CAREFUSIO OP0702 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC OP0702 N/A $28.76 $28.76
8 Blount Knee Retractor 1 EA INTEGRA 27-223 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 27-223 N/A $191.51 $191.51
9 Bone Spreader 7mm Beak Width 1 EA SYNTHES 398.93 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00

10 Bonney Tissue Forceps 1 EA SYMMETRY 06-8791 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 6-148 N/A $86.19 $86.19
11 Brown Adson 1 EA SYMMETRY 30-1189 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
12 Burgess Carpal Tunnel Ret 1 EA INOMED 1887 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
13 CarmaIt Artery Curved Forceps 1 EA SYMMETRY 16-3716 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC SU2777 N/A $42.30 $42.30
14 Carmalt Artery Straight Forceps 1 EA SYMMETRY 16-3616 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
15 Clamp,  Gemini,  Right  Angle, 7 1/2" 2 EA SYMMETRY 54-7256 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 7-256 N/A $137.97 $275.94
16 Clamp, Adson  Curved 7 1/2" 2 EA SYMMETRY 17-2151 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 285106 N/A $52.11 $104.23
17 Clamp, Adson, Fine, Curved 1 EA SYMMETRY 16-4118 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
18 Clamp, Allis, Long 3 EA SYMMETRY 50-0219 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
19 Clamp, Allis, Short 3 EA SYMMETRY 50-0216 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
20 Clamp, Allis, Short 3 EA SYMMETRY 50-0216 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
21 Clamp, Hemostatic, Curved 5 1/2" 8 EA SYMMETRY 15-7314 Fine Surgical 36054 1 yr $1.64 $13.12 AESCULAP INC BH135R N/A $18.00 $144.00
22 Clamp, Kelly, Curved, 6" 4 EA SYMMETRY 16-1116 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
23 Clamp, Kelly, Curved, 7 1/4" 2 EA SYMMETRY 16-1118 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
24 Clamp, Kocher, Curved, Medium, 6 1/4" 2 EA SYMMETRY 16-1316 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC SU2810 N/A $22.84 $45.69
25 Clamp, Kocher, Gyn, Straight, 8" 2 EA SYMMETRY 16-1220 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
26 Clamp, Kocher, Straight, 7" 2 EA SYMMETRY 16-1218 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
27 Clamp, Meeker, Right Angle, 7" 2 EA SYMMETRY 54-5005 No Bid $0.00 SYMMETRY SURGICAL 54-5005 N/A $108.99 $217.97
28 Clamp, Mosquito, Curved, 5" 8 EA SYMMETRY 15-4512 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
29 Clamp, Mosquito, Curved, 5" 8 EA SYMMETRY 15-4512 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
30 Clamp, Mosquito, Fine, Curved 2 EA SYMMETRY 15-4182 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
31 Crile Forceps Curved 5 1/2" 5 EA SKLAR 17-3155 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 17-3155 N/A $53.99 $269.93
32 Crile Forceps Straight 5 1/2" 5 EA SKLAR 17-3055 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 17-3055 N/A $53.99 $269.93
33 Curette, Bruns, 9", #00 1 EA SYMMETRY 29-5542 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
34 Curette, Bruns, 9",#0 1 EA SYMMETRY 29-5550 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC N-02045 N/A $283.84 $283.84
35 Curette, Bruns, Angled, 9", #3 1 EA SYMMETRY 29-5553AV No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 40-7227 N/A $161.81 $161.81
36 Curette, Bruns, Straight, 9", #1 1 EA SYMMETRY 29-5551 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
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37 Curette, Spinal Fusion, Oval, 8", #000 1 EA SYMMETRY 29-5028 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC VM81-8152 N/A $222.56 $222.56
38 Curette, Spinal, Angled, 8", #00 1 EA SYMMETRY 29-4939 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC RE0822 N/A $120.91 $120.91
39 Curette, Spinal, Straight, 8", #0 2 EA SYMMETRY 29-5030 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC VM81-8154 N/A $222.56 $445.11
40 Curette, Spinal, Straight, 8", #00 1 EA SYMMETRY 29-5029 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC VM81-8153 N/A $222.56 $222.56
41 Curette, Spinal, Straight, 8", #1 1 EA SYMMETRY 29-5031 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC VM81-8154 N/A $222.56 $222.56
42 Cutter, Bone, Double Action 1 EA SYMMETRY 33-5015 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
43 Dissecting Metzenbaum Scissors  9", Curved 5 EA SKLAR 55-9090 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 55-9090 N/A $187.64 $938.21
44 Elevator , Periosteal 1 EA SYMMETRY 26-6035 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC DELPR3 N/A $72.84 $72.84
45 Elevator, Freer, Double Ended, 7 1/2" 3 EA SYMMETRY 55-7026 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC MH18-1968 N/A $48.94 $146.83
46 Elevator, Joseph 1 EA SYMMETRY 26-4404 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 21-64 N/A $131.04 $131.04
47 Elevator, Key 3/8" 1 EA SYMMETRY 26-5620 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 27-821 N/A $142.10 $142.10
48 Elevator, Key, 1/4" 2 EA SYMMETRY 26-5606 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 27-820 N/A $142.87 $285.74
49 Elevator, Key, 1/2" 1 EA SYMMETRY 26-5612 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 27-822 N/A $141.46 $141.46
50 Forceps Dissecting/Ligature Gemini  8" 5 EA BR SURGICAL BR12-43120 No Bid $0.00 BR SURGICAL, LLC BR12-43120 N/A $102.09 $510.43
51 Forceps, Adson w/ Teeth 4 3/4" 5 EA SYMMETRY 06-2112 No Bid $0.00 MCKESSON CORPORATION 43-2-775 N/A $6.50 $32.50
52 Forceps, Adson w/o Teeth 1 EA SYMMETRY 06-20121 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 6-121 N/A $57.49 $57.49
53 Forceps 6 " Tissue Tweezer 2cm Serrated Tip 5 EA SKLAR 19-1260 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 19-1260 N/A $37.83 $189.14
54 Forceps, Bipolar 1 EA SYMMETRY 08-0045 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC F-1045 N/A $1,216.64 $1,216.64
55 Forceps, Carroll, Tendon Pulling 1 EA SYMMETRY 78-3020 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 270185 N/A $322.54 $322.54
56 Forceps, DeBakey, 2mm, 6" 1 EA SYMMETRY 55-2007 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC P6280 N/A $137.59 $137.59
57 Forceps, DeBakey, 3mm, 9 1/2" 1 EA SYMMETRY 55-2009 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
58 Forceps, DeBakey, Fine, 2mm, 7" 1 EA SYMMETRY 55-2005 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC P6280 N/A $137.59 $137.59
59 Forceps, Russian, Short, 6" 1 EA SYMMETRY 07-1515 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
60 Forceps, Tissue,  5", w/  Teeth 2 EA SYMMETRY 06-0513 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
61 Forceps, Tissue, 5 1/2", w/ Teeth 2 EA SYMMETRY 06-0514 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
62 Forceps, Tissue, 6", w/ Teeth 3 EA SYMMETRY 06-0515 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
63 Gemini Clamp 5 1/2" 1 EA SYMMETRY 19-5579 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 7-255 N/A $126.64 $126.64
64 Gemini Clamp 7 1/8" 1 EA SYMMETRY 54-7256 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 7-256 N/A $137.97 $137.97

65
German 8" Debakey Artery Atraumatic Tissue, Gold 
Handle 5 EA SKLAR 97-1541 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00

66 Grasper hook tip 1 EA ARTHREX AR-16600NR No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
67 Handle, Knife, #3 6 EA SYMMETRY 01-2703 No Bid $0.00 MCKESSON CORPORATION 43-1-033 N/A $8.23 $49.37
68 Handle, Knife, Double, #7 2 EA SYMMETRY 01-2707 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
69 Holman retractor blunt 2 EA V MUELL OS4160-011 No Bid $0.00 J & J HEALTHCARE SYSTEMS INC 224510001 N/A $1,325.63 $2,651.26
70 Holman retractor sharp 2 EA V MUELL OS4160-011 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
71 Hook, Dandy, Nerve, Straight 1 EA SYMMETRY 57-5001 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC E-0530 N/A $141.34 $141.34
72 Hook, Joseph, Double Prong, 10mm 2 EA SYMMETRY 20-5010 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 21-160 N/A $119.03 $238.06
73 Hook, Single Prong 3 EA SYMMETRY 20-5001 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 60-6280 N/A $137.63 $412.89

74
Jacobson-Adson Plastic Surgery Forcepss 4 3/4" - 
Straight Fine Point 5 EA SKLAR 98-2062 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
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75 Langenbeck Retractor 1 EA SYMMETRY 50-4256 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 11-160 N/A $127.04 $127.04
76 Mallet 1 EA SYMMETRY 27-0880 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
77 Mallet, SS, Large 2 EA SYMMETRY 27-0400 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
78 Mayo Scissors 6 3/4" Curved Tungsten Carbide 5 EA SKLAR 16-1610 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 16-1610 N/A $385.51 $1,927.57

79 Mayo-Hegar Needle Holder, Tungsten Carbide 7" 5 EA SKLAR 21-2570 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 21-8032 N/A $256.10 $1,280.50

80 Mayo-Hegar Needle Holder, Tungsten Carbide 8" 5 EA SKLAR 21-2480 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 21-2480 N/A $225.70 $1,128.50
81 Miltex Hemostatic Forcepss Mixter 7-1/4" 5 EA MILTEX 7-202 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 7-202 N/A $135.06 $675.29
82 Miltex Meisterhand Knife Handle #3 5 EA MILTEX 98HMH4-7 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 4-10 N/A $56.50 $282.50
83 Miltex Meisterhand Knife Handle #7 5 EA MILTEX MH4-9 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC MH4-9 N/A $21.27 $106.36
84 Miltex Poole Suction Tube 30' Straight 5 EA MILTEX MLTX-10-312 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 10-312 N/A $118.50 $592.50

85
Miltex Stainless Steelware & Surgical Intrument 
Stringers 5 EA MILTEX MLTX3-99 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 3-99 N/A $102.64 $513.21

86 Needleholder, Crile Wood, 6" 3 EA SYMMETRY 32-430 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 96-2590 N/A $483.77 $1,451.31
87 Needleholder, Crile Wood, 7" 3 EA SYMMETRY 32-320 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
88 Needleholder, Mayo Hegar Diamond Jaw 8" 1 EA SYMMETRY 32-140 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
89 Needleholder, Webster, Smooth, 5" 3 EA SYMMETRY 32-405 No Bid $0.00 BR SURGICAL, LLC BR98-104480 N/A $60.74 $182.23
90 Needleholders, Olsen Hegar 1 EA SYMMETRY 32-170 No Bid $0.00 BR SURGICAL, LLC BR24-41016 N/A $70.19 $70.19
91 Osteome CVD 1 EA SYMMETRY 57-3817 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
92 Osteotome, 2mm 1 EA CAREFUSIO RH1465-2 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC RH1465-2 N/A $140.41 $140.41
93 Osteotome, 4mm 1 EA CAREFUSIO RH1465-4 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC RH1465-4 N/A $118.84 $118.84
94 Osteotome, 6mm 1 EA CAREFUSIO RH1465-6 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC RH1465-6 N/A $133.60 $133.60
95 Osteotome, 8mm 1 EA CAREFUSIO RH1465-8 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC RH1465-8 N/A $155.44 $155.44
96 Osteotome, Curved, 1/4" 1 EA SYMMETRY 57-3817 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 62-169 N/A $60.80 $60.80
97 Osteotome, Lambotte, Straight, 1/4" 1 EA SYMMETRY 28-9406 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 40-6560 N/A $153.83 $153.83
98 Osteotome, Straight, 1/4" 1 EA SYMMETRY 57-3807 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
99 Pliers 3 EA SYMMETRY 14-5001 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

100 Rasp, Double Ended, Mini 1 EA SYMMETRY 67-5970 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
101 Rasp, Fomon 1 EA SYMMETRY 67-5960 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 21-368 N/A $230.80 $230.80
102 Retractor McCullough Cobb, 19 mm 1 EA SYMMETRY 57-5619 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
103 Retractor,  McCullough Cobb, 13mm 1 EA SYMMETRY 57-5613 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
104 Retractor,  Ribbon Small 1" x 13" 1 EA SYMMETRY 22-0252 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 200222 N/A $16.47 $16.47
105 Retractor, Army/Navy, 8 1/4" 6 EA SYMMETRY 22-1821 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
106 Retractor, Crile Double-Ended 2 EA SYMMETRY 20-0930 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 200138 N/A $25.80 $51.60
107 Retractor, Deaver, 51mm, 2", 13" 5 EA MEDLINE MDS1818750 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
108 Retractor, Heiss Self Retaining Small 1 EA SYMMETRY 24-0910 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC VM29-4254 N/A $483.09 $483.09
109 Retractor, Hohmanm, Baby, 6mm 6 EA SYMMETRY 77-1050 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
110 Retractor, Ragnell 2 EA SYMMETRY 20-0525 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC OS930 N/A $33.80 $67.60
111 Retractor, Richardson 3/4" W x 1" D   9 1/2" L 1 EA SYMMETRY 23-4501 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC SU3473 N/A $219.14 $219.14
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112 Retractor, Richardson, Appendiceal, 3/4" x 2" 1 EA SYMMETRY 23-4504 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 11-249 N/A $134.20 $134.20
113 Retractor, Senn, Dull 6 EA SYMMETRY 20-0509 No Bid $0.00 N/A $0.00 $0.00
114 Retractor, Senn, Sharp 6 EA SYMMETRY 20-0508 No Bid $0.00 AESCULAP INC MG276R N/A $28.21 $169.29
115 Retractor, Vein 1 EA SYMMETRY 20-1750 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 11-102 N/A $116.63 $116.63
116 Retractor, Weitlaner, 2x3 Prong, Blunt 1 EA SYMMETRY 24-2210 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
117 Retractor, Weitlaner, 2x3 Prong, Sharp, 5 1/2" 3 EA SYMMETRY 24-2213 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC SA3110 N/A $44.10 $132.30
118 Retractor, Weitlaner, 3x4 Prong, Sharp, 6 1/2" 1 EA SYMMETRY 24-2216 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 204155 N/A $67.49 $67.49
119 Retractor, Weitlaner, Sharp, 6 1/4" 1 EA SYMMETRY 24-2216 No Bid $0.00 BR SURGICAL, LLC BR18-67016 N/A $233.01 $233.01
120 Retractor/Rake, Volkman, 4 Prong, Dull 2 EA SYMMETRY 22-3504 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 190177 N/A $30.70 $61.40
121 Retractors, Deaver, 25mm, 1", 10" 5 EA MEDLINE MDS1818225 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC PM-4571FO N/A $477.93 $2,389.64
122 Richardson Retractor - 9-1/4" (23.5 cm) 5 EA MEDLINE MDS1815003 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
123 Richardson Retractor 1-5/8"W x 2 1/2" D 5 EA SYMMETRY 23-4505 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC SA3476 N/A $15.01 $75.07

124
Richardson Retractor with 1-1/2" x 1-1/2" (38 mm x 38 
mm) Blade 5 EA MEDLINE MDS1815003 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC SA3474 N/A $15.01 $75.07

125 Rochester-Pean Forceps Curved 61/4" 5 EA SKLAR 17-2262 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 17-2262 N/A $75.16 $375.79
126 Rochester-Pean Forceps Curved 8" 5 EA SKLAR 17-2280 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 17-2280 N/A $99.01 $495.07
127 Rongeur,  Pituitary, Curved,  Large 1 EA CAREFUSIO OS3070 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC OS3070 N/A $126.69 $126.69
128 Rongeur, Curved 1 EA SYMMETRY 30-7103 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
129 Rongeur, Leksell, 9" 1 EA SYMMETRY 31-5108 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 25-512 N/A $368.49 $368.49
130 Rongeur, Lempert, Curved 1 EA SYMMETRY 30-7624 No Bid $0.00 MEDLINE INDUSTRIES I68300 N/A $777.04 $777.04
131 Rongeur, Lempert, Curved, 7" 1 EA SYMMETRY 30-7625 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 26-192 N/A $446.94 $446.94
132 Rongeur, Pituitary, Curved, Small 1 EA SYMMETRY 30-7620 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
133 Rongeur, Straight 1 EA SYMMETRY 30-0201 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC VM81-2413 N/A $1,488.66 $1,488.66
134 Ruler, Metal, 6" 2 EA SYMMETRY 44-3715 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 06-2860 N/A $10.44 $20.89

135 Schnidt Tonsil Hemostatic Forceps Slight Curve 7 1/2" 5 EA SKLAR 74-3073 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 96-2271M N/A $20.16 $100.79
136 Scissors,  Bandage, w/ Plastic Handle 2 EA SYMMETRY 40-4720 Magnum Medical 36096 1 yr 1.51 $3.02 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC SU2012-001 N/A $17.04 $34.09
137 Scissors, Bandage 1 EA SYMMETRY 40-2514 Fine Surgical 36180 1 yr 2.24 $2.24 PATTERSON MEDICAL SUPPLY INC A37190 N/A $13.80 $13.80
138 Scissors, Bandage, w/ Plastic Handle 1 EA SYMMETRY 40-4720 Magnum Medical 36096 1 yr 1.51 $1.51 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC SU2012-001 N/A $17.04 $17.04
139 Scissors, Curved Mayo 6" 1 EA NEW MATIC MEDICAL 45200702115 No Bid $0.00 BR SURGICAL, LLC BR08-17115 N/A $63.80 $63.80

140 Scissors, Fiber Wire, Suture, w/ Black Handle Arthrex 1 EA ARTHREX AR-11796 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
141 Scissors, Iris, Straight 1 EA SYMMETRY 02-2110 Fine Surgical 36027 1 yr 0.99 $0.99 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 22-1150 N/A $87.14 $87.14
142 Scissors, Mayo, Curved 2 EA SYMMETRY 80-5117 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 95-117 N/A $191.46 $382.91
143 Scissors, Mayo, Straight, 6 3/4" 2 EA SYMMETRY 32-830 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC 32-4830 N/A $757.09 $1,514.17
144 Scissors, Metzenbaum, w/ Black Handle 1 EA SYMMETRY 214-33-18 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 5-SC-284 N/A $156.87 $156.87
145 Scissors, Mtezenbaum, curved 7" 3 EA SYMMETRY 32-750 No Bid $0.00 MCKESSON CORPORATION 43-1-340 N/A $29.04 $87.13
146 Scissors, Potts Tenotomy, Curved,  5 1/2" 2 EA V. MUELLER CH5674-001 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC CH5674-001 N/A $152.46 $304.91
147 Scissors, Potts Tenotomy, Curved,  6" 2 EA V. MUELLER CH5675 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC CH5675 N/A $98.94 $197.89
148 Scissors, Potts Tenotomy, Curved,  7" 2 EA V. MUELLER CH5676 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC CH5676 N/A $146.83 $293.66

Page 4 of 5

https://www.medline.com/sku/item/MDPMDS1815003;ecomsessionid=WNBtR9sjo5SyJCiYpfH-wMPXgh9rgYJxDEw3ZFqA.OCR2-b2b?skuIndex=S4&question=&flowType=&indexCount=


Tabsheet COBB COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
RFQ 2022005, SURGICAL INSTRUMENTS AND ACCESSORIES FOR CITA

149 Scissors, Potts Tenotomy, Curved, 8" 2 EA SYMMETRY 04-5677 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC CH5677 N/A $152.29 $304.57
150 Scissors, Tenotomy, Curved, 7 1/8" 2 SYMMETRY 04-6718 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC MH18-1466 N/A $69.49 $138.97
151 Scissors, Wire 1 EA SYMMETRY 914-2312 No Bid $0.00 MEDLINE INDUSTRIES MDS10508 N/A $6.20 $6.20

152
Self Retaining Retractor Snap Closure Frame Only 203 
(8") 1 EA MILLENIUM SURGICAL 33-64416102 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

153 Silicone Pin Mats For Surgical Instrument Trays 5 EA SKLAR 10-4965 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 10-4965 N/A $421.53 $2,107.64

154
Sklar Rochester-Ochsner (Kocher) Forcepss 7 1/4" 
(Straight) 5 EA SKLAR 17-2872 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 17-2872 N/A $74.11 $370.57

155 Skylar Dry Prep Sponge Stick 6" (100 Count) 5 EA SKLAR 96-7040 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 96-7040 N/A $3.66 $18.29
156 Sponge Stick, Straight, 9" 3 EA SYMMETRY 19-5024 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
157 Spreader, Laminar 1 EA SYMMETRY 27-5584 No Bid $0.00 INTEGRA YORK PA INC 26-2000 N/A $584.44 $584.44
158 Suction Tip, Frazier, 12fr with stylet 1 EA SYMMETRY 09-8312 No Bid $0.00 CARDINAL HEALTHCARE 166026 N/A $44.10 $44.10
159 Suction Tip, Frazier, 8fr with stylet 2 EA SYMMETRY 09-8308 No Bid $0.00 JEDMED INSTRUMENT COMPANY 33-0408 N/A $77.16 $154.31

160 T/C German Metzenbaum Scissors, 7" Curved Blunt 5 EA SKLAR 16-2115 No Bid $0.00 BR SURGICAL, LLC BR08-28518 N/A $144.47 $722.36
161 Tamps, Bone, Set of 6 1 EA BOSS 73-2717 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

162 TC Halsey Needle Holder; Smooth Tungsten Carbide 5 5 EA SKLAR 21-8000 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 21-8000 N/A $229.16 $1,145.79
163 Thumb Tissue Forceps with 1 x 2 Teeth, 8.00" 5 EA GER MED USA G12-13 No Bid $0.00 GRAHAM FIELD 2749 N/A $2.40 $12.00
164 Towel Clip, Backhaus,  Perforating,  Large, 5 1/4" 6 EA SYMMETRY 17-5513 No Bid $0.00 MCKESSON CORPORATION 43-1-611 N/A $20.67 $124.03
165 Towel Clip, Perforating, Small 2 EA SYMMETRY 17-5508 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

166 Tungsten Carbide Mayo Dissecting Straight Scissors, 7" 5 EA SKLAR 16-1510 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 16-1510 N/A $347.27 $1,736.36
167 US Army Navy Retractor  8 1/4" (2 Pack) 5 EA SKLAR 60-1085 No Bid $0.00 SKLAR INSTRUMENT 60-1085 N/A $107.87 $539.36
168 V. Mueller Sterilization Container, 4" X 11" x 12" 5 EA GENESIS CD1-4C No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC CD1-4C N/A $359.99 $1,799.93
169 Volkmann Prong Blunt 2 EA SYMMETRY 22-3502 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
170 Wilson Trigger Finger Retractor 1 EA INOMED 1884 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

171 Yankauer Standard Bulb Tip, Control Vent, 20 per case 5 CS CONMED CON-0034920 No Bid $0.00 CAREFUSION SOLUTIONS LLC SU2542 N/A $24.79 $123.93
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