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Vendor: Leaning Labs, Inc. Project Lead The Way, Inc.

Terms: Net 30 days Net 30

# Description Unit Price Unit Price
Kits
1 |PLTW Digital Electronics VEX Kit, 270-1922 No bid $126.25
2 |PLTW EES VEX 1Q Kit, 228-7340 No bid $201.00
3 |PLTW ESS VEX IQ Supplemental Kit, 228-7341 No bid $50.50
4 |PLTW IED VEX IQ Kit, 228-7342 No bid $247.25
5 |PLTW V5 Motor Upgrade Kit, 270-7247-801 No bid $177.00
6 |PLTW VEX I1Q Construction Kit, 228-3303 No bid $131.75
7 |PLTW VEX IQ Robot Design Kit, 228-3304 No bid $425.00
8 |VEX Aerospace Engineering Kit, 270-1789 No bid $1,030.00
9 |VEX AMM Kit, 276-2045 $38.49 $38.00
10 |VEX Gateway to Technology Kit, 270-1920 No bid $1,229.00
11 |VEX Performance Took Kit, 276-1645 No bid $54.00
12 |VEX Principles of Engineering Kit, 270-1921 No bid $1,780.00
13 |VEX V5 AE Custom Upgrade Kit, 270-7248 No bid $768.00
14 |VEX V5 Classroom Starter Bundle, 276-7070 $3,899.00 No bid
15 |VEX V5 Classroom Starter Kit, 276-7010 $674.00 No bid
16 |VEX V5 Classroom Super Bundle, 276-7080 $7,799.00 No bid
17 |VEX V5 Classroom Super Kit, 276-7020 $1,324.00 No bid
18 |VEX V5 Competition Starter Kit, 276-7030 $1,024.00 No bid
19 |VEX V5 Competition Super Kit, 276-7040 $1,674.00 No bid
20 |VEX V5 Gateway Custom Kit, 270-7920 No bid $1,653.00
21 |VEX V5 Gateway Custom Upgrade Kit, 270-7247 No bid $973.00
22 |VEX V5 POE/CIM Custom Kit, 270-7921 No bid $2,024.00
23 |VEX V5 POE/CIM Custom Kit, 270-7921 No bid $2,024.00
24 |VEX V5 POE/CIM Custom Upgrade Kit, 270-8014 No bid $1,093.00
25 |VEX V5 System Bundle, 276-7000 $621.00 No bid
26 |VEX V5 Workcell $2,662.00 No bid
# Description Discount/Percent Mark-up/Hourly Rate Discount/Percent Mark-up/Hourly Rate
Additional Items
27 |Percent Discount for Related Items N/A 0% discount
Annual Participation Fees: Launch (ES) $950/year; Gateway (MS)
28 |Hourly Rate for Additional Related Services On-Site service and/or training $750.00 per day. (s:ss)os/fsoréz;z;?fag;c;LZ:E:;&?L;ZZ'EE(/J\/{ZZ?T'(SIZ:LT::;?;I;Z;Z
for HS offering all 3 programs.)
# Description Vendor Response Vendor Response
Training
29 |List training included in the price of the equipment. Training available for $750.00 a day N/A
Core Training Fees: Launch Classroom Teacher (16 hrs) $500/seat;
Launch Lead Teacher (16 hrs) $700/seat; Gateway Units (27 hrs)
30 |List any additional training available or on line support. Toll free technical support available #800-334-4943 SEE A ERRTY) l::lliss ((;(O) ::SS)) 552131(())(0)//222::’, High School program
Tech & General Support included in Participation Fee - contact PLTW
Solution Center at (877) 335-7589 or solutioncenter@pltw.org

Warranty
31 [Warranty Information Manufacturer warranty only on equipment/supplies.
Other
If company has a local representative, list individual’s name and contact information. David B. Richardson, david.richardson@Ili.com, 800-334-4943 Casey Martin - cmartin@pltw.org

Please indicate lead time upon receipt of order.

15-30 days

Up to 28 days unless otherwise noted in the PLTW Store

Awarded items highligted in yellow.
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